
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

July 29, 2008 
WORK SESSION   

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL   
TOWN OF OCEAN CITY  

 
In attendance:  Mayor Rick Meehan, Council President Joe Mitrecic, Council Secretary Nancy Howard, 
Council Members Jim Hall, Jay Hancock, Mary Knight and Lloyd Martin, City Manager Dennis Dare, 
Acting City Solicitor Heather Stansbury, Assistant to City Manager Kathy Mathias, Public Works 
Director Hal Adkins, Public Works Maintenance Superintendent Bruce Gibbs, City Engineer Terry 
McGean, Fire Marshal Sam Villani, Ocean City Volunteer Fire Chief Chris Larmore, Emergency 
Services Director Joe Theobald, Emergency Medical Services Captain Chuck Barton, City Clerk Carol 
Jacobs, Deputy City Clerk Kelly Allmond, Members of the Press and Interested Parties.  Council 
Member Margaret Pillas was absent. 
 
Council President Joe Mitrecic called this work session to order at 12:00 p.m.; then, Council Member 
Lloyd Martin moved to convene into closed session to discuss legal, personnel, real estate and 
contractual matters; seconded by Council Member Jim Hall. The vote was 5-0 with Council 
Members Jay Hancock and Margaret Pillas absent.  
 
The Open Session reconvened at 1:05 p.m..   
 

1. Council President Joe Mitrecic reported on the closed session held prior to this open session at 
12:00 p.m..  Topics of discussion were: (1) to discuss the appointment, employment, assignment, 
removal or resignation of appointees, employees or officials over whom it has jurisdiction; or, 
any other personnel matter that affects one or more specific individuals; (2) to consider the 
acquisition of real property for a public purpose, and matters directly related thereto; (3) to 
consult with counsel to obtain legal advice; (4) to consult with Staff, Consultants or other 
individuals about pending or potential litigations; (5) to comply with a specific constitutional, 
statutory or judicially imposed requirement that prevents public disclosures about a particular 
proceeding or matter; (5) to discuss a matter directly related to a negotiation strategy or the 
contents of a bid or proposal, if public discussion or disclosure adversely impacts the public 
body's ability to competitively bid or make proposals.  Persons present were:  Mayor Rick 
Meehan, Council President Joe Mitrecic, Council Secretary Nancy Howard, Council Members 
Jim Hall, Jay Hancock, Mary Knight and Lloyd Martin, City Manager Dennis Dare, Acting City 
Solicitor Heather Stansbury, Assistant to City Manager Kathy Mathias, Roy Frick and Peck 
Miller.  

 
2. In accordance with the Town’s Employee Recognition Program, Finance Administrator Martha 

Lucey introduced Finance Department Employees Barbara Dahan and Brenda LeKites. 
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3. Bid openings: 

 
A. Boardwalk Railings 

(Staff Estimate:  $70,000.00, *bid bond required) 
 

Vendor 
Wally’s Iron Works, Inc., Mt. Airy, Maryland 
Metal Magic, Ocean City, Maryland 
Delta Sales Corp., Selbyville, Delaware 
Abel Fence, LLC, Wilmington, Delaware 
AVTECH Specialties, LLC, Lakewood, New Jersey 
 
Council Member Jim Hall moved to acknowledge all bids with remand to Staff for 
review; seconded by Council Member Mary Knight. The vote was 6-0 with Council 
Member Margaret Pillas absent. 
 

B. Annual Standby Generator Preventative Maintenance Program 
(Staff Estimate = $26,000.00, no bid bond required) 
 

Vendor 
Fidelity Engineering, Sparks Maryland - Notice of “No-Bid” 
Fidelity Engineering, Sparks Maryland - Sealed Bid 
Curtis Engine and Equipment, Inc., Baltimore, Maryland 
J. G. Parks & Son, Grasonville, Maryland 
Alban Engine Power Systems, Ocean City, Maryland 
Kelly Generator, Owings Mills, Maryland 
 
Council Member Jim Hall moved to acknowledge all bids with remand to Staff for 
review; seconded by Council Member Mary Knight. The vote was 6-0 with Council 
Member Margaret Pillas absent.  
 

C. Three (3) Stryker Ambulance Cots 
(FY09 Budget Allocation = $28,200.00, no bid bond required) 
 

Council Member Lloyd Martin moved to open the single bid; seconded by Council 
Member Mary Knight. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas 
absent.    
 
Council Member Jim Hall moved to accept the bid from Stryker EMS Equipment, 
for the trade-in value of $8,807.46 each, with remand to Staff for review; seconded 
by Council Member Lloyd Martin. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member 
Margaret Pillas absent. 
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D. Boardwalk Lumber, Quantity = 4,000 pieces 

(FY09 Budget Allocation = $62,000.00 ($15.50 per piece), no bid bond required) 
Vendor Bid (per piece) 

Grasmick Lumber Co., Baltimore, Maryland $13.45 
Long Life Lumber, Hebron, Maryland $13.76 
Bankstar Lumber $14.02 
Middle Atlantic Wholesale Lumber, Owings Mills, Maryland $15.60 
Apache Forest Products, Midlothian, Virginia $14.24 
Integrity Quality Service Enterprises, Inc., Baltimore, Maryland $20.46 
Biewer Lumber, St. Clair, Michigan $10.70 
O’Shea, Glen Rock, Pennsylvania $14.77 wet & $16.56 dry
Engles Lumber & Supply, Middletown, Maryland $18.23 
Dunkirk Supply, Dunkirk, Maryland (three separate bids received) $11.80  
Dunkirk Supply, Dunkirk, Maryland $9.65 
Dunkirk Supply, Dunkirk, Maryland $14.30 
J.F. Johnson Lumber Company LLC, Easton, Maryland $17.17 

  
Council Member Jim Hall moved to acknowledge the apparent low bid from 
Dunkirk Supply with remand to Staff for review; seconded by Council Member 
Mary Knight. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas absent.  

 
4. Lieutenant Greg Guiton presented General Order 200 C-2, entitled Disciplinary Process – 

Disciplinary Matrix, for approval. Council Member Jim Hall moved to approve; seconded by 
Council Member Lloyd Martin. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas 
absent. The Mayor concurred with the vote. 

 
5. Lieutenant Guiton presented General Order 500 S-1, entitled Secondary Employment, for 

approval.  The Council deferred this item to the Police Commission for language revisions. 
  

6. Council Member Lloyd Martin presented the Police Commission’s recommendation to raise the 
Taxi Cab Fuel Surcharges (see Attachment A).  Council Member Jim Hall moved to increase 
the Taxi Cab Fuel Surcharge to $1.00 per trip until October 2008, at which time the Police 
Commission will review the surcharge again; seconded by Council Member Jay Hancock. 
The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas absent.  

 
7. Finance Administrator Martha Lucey presented, for approval, the final draft of the Procurement 

Card Policy.  Council Member Jay Hancock moved to accept the Policy and Procedure as 
presented; seconded by Council Member Jim Hall. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member 
Margaret Pillas absent. 

 
8. Emergency Services Director Joe Theobald, accompanied by Emergency Management Planner 

Richard “Buzzy” Bayles, gave an overview of the Town’s Emergency Operations Plan.  Council 
Member Jay Hancock moved to approve the revised plan as presented; seconded by 
Council Member Jim Hall. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas absent. 
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9. Ocean City Volunteer Fire Chief Chris Larmore presented a report of the OCVFC’s goals and 
objectives (see Attachment B). 

 
(See Attachment B, Page 7, Item #3) Council Member Lloyd Martin moved to accept the 
Joint Committee’s recommendation to change the name of the Ocean City Volunteer Fire 
Service to “Ocean City Fire Department”; seconded by Council Member Mary Knight. The 
vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas absent.

 
10. Planning and Community Development Director Jesse Houston presented the Planning 

Commission’s recommendation to amend zoning regulations for LC-1, SC-1 and BM-1. Director 
Houston recommended another public hearing to give affected residents another opportunity to 
comment.  Council Secretary Nancy Howard moved to accept Director Houston’s 
recommendation; seconded by Council Member Mary Knight. The vote was 6-0 with 
Council Member Margaret Pillas absent.  

 
11. Director Houston presented proposed changes to zoning fees (see Attachment C).  Council 

Member Jim Hall moved to approve the recommended fees; seconded by Council Member 
Jay Hancock. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas absent.  

 
12. Assistant to City Manager Kathy Mathias presented the 2009 Council Meeting and Work Session 

Schedule for approval.  Council Member Lloyd Martin moved to approve; seconded by 
Council Member Jim Hall. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas absent.  

 
13. Council Member Jim Hall reported on the Recreation and Parks Committee Meeting held on 

March 11, 2008 (see Attachment D). 
 

Mayor Rick Meehan said the new dog park’s official name is the “OC Dog Park.”  He assured the 
public that the park was not dedicated to Tom Shuster. 
 

14. Council Member Mary Knight reported on the Tourism Commission Meetings held on June 5 and 
July 3, 2008 (see Attachment E). 

 
Council Secretary Nancy Howard advised that Atlantic General Hospital presented the Town with a 
plaque in appreciation of the Town’s financial aid for their new health center. 
 
Council Member Jim Hall moved to adjourn at 3:00 p.m.; seconded by Council Member Jim 
Hall. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas absent.
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ATTACHMENT A     
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ATTACHMENT B 
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ATTACHMENT C  
 
 

 



Work Session 7-29-08 continued…  Page 15 of 17 
  July 29, 2008 
 

 

ATTACHMENT D



Work Session 7-29-08 continued…  Page 16 of 17 
  July 29, 2008 
 

 

ATTACHMENT E 
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