October 19, 2009
Regular Session #20
Mayor and City Council

Town of Ocean City, Maryland

m

Present:
Mayor Richard W. Meehan Council Members
Council President Joseph M. Mitrecic James S. Hall
Council Secretary Lloyd E. Martin Mary P. Knight
Douglas S. Cymek
Absent: Joseph T. Hall, I1
Margaret L. Pillas '
ATTENDANCE

Mayor Rick Meehan, Council President Joe Mitrecic, Council Secretary Lloyd Martin, Council
Members Jim Hall, Margaret Pillas, Mary Knight, Doug Cymek and Joe Hall, City Manager Dennis
Dare, City Solicitor Guy Ayres, Assistant to City Manager Kathy Mathias, Planning and Community
Development Director Jesse Houston, Senior Project Manager Dean Dashiell, City Clerk Carol Jacobs,
Members of the Press and Interested Parties

CALL TO ORDER
Council President Joe Mitrecic called this Regular Session to order at 6:03 p.m., in the Council
Chambers of City Hall, 301 Baltimore Avenue, Ocean City, Maryland 21842.

PRAYER & PLEDGE
Reverend Beverly Stang of the Bethany United Methodist Church led the prayer, and Mayor Rick
Meehan led the Pledge of Allegiance.

CITY MANAGER’S REPORT ON UPCOMING WORK SESSION
City Manager Dare reported that the following items will be discussed in the upcoming work session:

1. Bid openings for the Convention Center Walk-in Refrigerator Freezer Raised Insulated
Floor System, and, the Data Center’s fire extinguisher system

2. Overview of the IAFF Contract — presented by Stephen Silvestri of Miles and Stockbridge

3. State Highway Fall Meeting — presented by Donnie Drewer, District Engineer

4. Recommendation of Advertising Agency Award — presented by Council Member Mary
Knight

5. Recommendation of Bid Award for the Sea For Yourself Design — presented by Tourism
Director Deb Travers

6. Discussion of Employee Pension and Health Care Benefits — presented by City Manager
Dennis Dare

7. Report on Police Commission Meeting Minutes of September 9, 2009 — presented by
Council Secretary Lloyd Martin

Council President Joe Mitrecic advised that next week’s work session will be called to order at 11:00
a.m.. The Council will immediately convene into closed session and will re-open for public discussion
at 1:00 p.m..
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COMMENTS FROM CITIZENS

Herb Pawlukewicz asked if impact fees could be used to fund ADA Transportation. Council President
Mitrecic said that impact fees must be used in accordance with the law. Also, Mr. Pawlukewicz said
he feels that the Downtown Association should assume the responsibilities of the Ocean City
Development Corporation. Thirdly, he suggested visitor paid parking system for visitors uptown.

Ellie Diegelmann commented on funding the wastewater project, and, the selection process for the
advertising agencies.

Council Member Doug Cymek moved to convene into closed session at 1:00 p.m. on Tuesday,
October 14" and Thursday, October 16, 2009 at the Roland E. Powell Convention Center to
discuss contractual matters; seconded by Council Member Mary Knight. The vote was
unanimous.

COMMENTS FROM THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL
Mayor Meehan advised that, during the Maryland Teachers Association Convention, he met with
Governor Martin O’Malley to discuss the Route 90 Bridge.

ADJOURNMENT

Council Member Jim Hall moved to adjourn at 7:25 p.m.; seconded by Council Secretary Lloyd
Martin. The vote was 6-0 with Council Member Margaret Pillas absent.




ATTACHMENT A

FIRE DEPARTMENT
UNIFORM BID INFORMATION

PRICE QUOTE FORM

Dress Shirt

Elbeco

Paragon Plus, /S shirts, white "open weave” 4.25 ounce
poplin - blend 65% Fortrel polyester/35% combed cotton,
fused convertible collars, pleated w/lined scalloped flaps with
hook and loop closures, long loose badge tab above left
pocket, left pencil pocket, cross stitched shoulder straps, full
lined ptacket fronts, white badge tabs not visible under 2.5 in.
badge.

Men's and women's

$23.25

$279.00

Shirt

Blauer

8213

SIS shirt,Fire Retardant Shirt Kermel/FR Rayon Blend 50/50
5.2 oz. twill, dk navy {customer supplied patches to be sewn
on each sleeve).

Men's and women's

42

$53.90

$2,263.80

Shirt

Blauer

8910X

S/8 shirt, cotton blend, color #12 gray, EM (customer
supplied patches to be sewn on each sleeve).

Men's and women's

36

$32.95

$1,186.20

Shirt

Blauer

8910X

S/S shirt, cotton blend, color #2 white, EM (customer
supplied patches to be sewn on each sleave).

Men's and women's

36

$32.95

$1,186.20

Shirt

Blauer

8713x

S/8 shirt, cotton blend, color #4 navy, EM (customer supplied
patches to be sewn on each sleeve).E14

Men's and women's

120

$29.70

$3,564.00

Pant

Blauer

8821X

Color #04, navy, HM (hemmed to specific lengths).

Men's and women's
(including long
rise/full cut)

200

$40.30

$8,060.00

Pant

Blauer

8210

Fire Retardant Trousers (6 Pocket) Kermel/FR rayon blend
50/50, 14.0 oz twill, dk navy. Hemmed to specific lengths.

Men's and women's

100

$87.20

$8,720.00

T- Shirt

Hanes

Beefy-T H5190

Pocket T. 100% ring-spun cotton, 6.1 ounce heavyweight, pre-}
shrunk, coverseamed neck and shoulder-to-shoulder tape,
double-needle sleeves and bottom hem, full cut dimensions,
tagless, deep navy. Ocean City Fire Dept lettering on back -
block lettering 3 lines total | line outline white - red letters and
emblem/tettering on front pocket .Note: Contact Fire Dept for
layout/lettering.

Small - 3XL

500

$7.50

$3,750.00

T- Shirt

Hanes

Beefy-T H5190

Pocket T. 100% ring-spun cotton, 6.1 ounce heavyweight, pre-|
shrunk, coverseamed neck and shoulder-to-shoulder tape,
double-needle sleeves and bottom hem, full cut dimensions,
tagless, white. Ocean City Fire Dept lettering on back - block
lettering 3 lines total 1 outline white - red letters and
emblem/lettering on front pocket. Note: Contact Fire Dept for
layout/lettering.

Small - 3XL

36

$6.70

$241.20

10

T- Shirt

Hanes

Beefy T 5190

Pocket T. 100% ring-spun cotton, 6.1 ounce heavyweight, pre-|
shrunk, coverseamed neck and shoulder-to-shoulder tape,
double-needte sleeves and bottom hem, full cut dimensions,
tagless, ash. Ocean City Fire Dept lettering on back - block
lettering 3 lines total 1 outline white - red letters and
emblervlettering on front. Note: Contact Fire Dept for
layout/lettering.

Small - 3XL

1"

Jacket

Blauer

5409

3 Season Bomber Jacket, Color #4 navy, 1 patch sewn on left
sleeve, 1 patch sewn on right sleeve (patches supplied by

Fire Dept.}

Men's and women's
sizes, plus tall

84

$7.05

$86.60

$592.20

$1,039.20

No i ions or ituti from the

will be




FIRE DEPARTMENT
UNIFORM BID INFORMATION

PRICE QUOTE FORM

s Yo Brand Rom Number Joain Description Bans Suaniity . PricoAnit TJotal Cost.
12 Name tags Blackinton J-1 Polished sliver, one line, black inlay. 21/2x1/2 10 $6.97 $69.70
13 Name tags Blackinton J-1 Polished gold, one line, black inlay. 21/12x172 10 $6.97 $69.70
City seal with silver border and Fire Dept rocker (sample .
14 Collar Devices Blackinton provided upon request). 120 $14.65 $1,758.00
Silver, Rhoglo, in ually numbered, black inlay, City Seal
15 Badge Blackinton B803 in center. 80 $44.57 $3,565.60
Gold, Higlo F/C, individually numbered, black inlay, City Seal
16 Badge Blackinton B803 in center. 12 $44.57 $534.84
Certified Emergency Response Jacket wiliner - dark navy
crosstech membrane, ripstop nylon outersheil, zip out B
warm fleece liner, patches sewn on sleeves - department )
patch on left sleeve - certification patch on right steeve Men's and women's
17 Jacket Blauer 98457 (patches supplied by Fire Dept.). sizes, plus tall 12 $194.45 $2,333.40
30 " NFPA 1999 Outerwear Supershell Jacket with Crosstech
Fabric; navy/f yel, zip-out B.Warm Fleece liner, illuniNite, dk | Men's and women's
18 Jacket Blauer 9970-1 navy/f yel. sizes, plus tall 12 $250.50 $3,006.00
Men's and women's
19 Pant Blauer 134 Rain Pants - black with adjustable waistband and cuffs. sizes, plus tall 12 $32.35 $388.20
Regular rain gear 30"., PVC Nylon, Scotchlite™ on sleeves , ,
and back, Ocean City Fire Dept reflective transfer on back. | Men's and women's
20 Rain Gear Neese UNS577-00-1/577 A Note: Cantact Fire Dept for layout, lettering. sizes. 20 $41.86 $837.20
21 Ties Clip on regular, black or navy. Regular 40 $2.60 $104.00
22 Ties Clip on regular, black or navy. Extra Long 10 $2.50 $25.00
23 Collar Devices Blackinton A-3614 Capt. 2 horns in gold circle. 15/16" 5 $14.81 $74.05
24 Collar Devices Blackinton A-2872 Deputy Chief, gold. 15/16" 4 $14.81 $59.24
25 Collar Devices Blackinton A-3574 Chief, gold. 15/16" 4 $14.81 $59.24
26 Collar Devices Blackinton A-3613 Lieutenant, silver. 15/16" 100 $14.81 $1,481.00
27 Pins Blackington Commendation, blue/white/blue-blue/red/blue-red/white/blue 100 $9.89 $989.00

No i it or Ftisti from the

will be




FIRE DEPARTMENT
UNIFORM BID INFORMATION

PRICE QUOTE FORM

28 White Gloves 60 $1.85 $111.00
American flag pins, tie tack closure, approx. 3/4" (sample
29 Pins provided upon request). 20 $0.99 $19.80
Dress Coat Style #13753, Dress Trousers Style #£1360, /S , ,
Shirt, Style P877. New York Bell Hat, navy, with gold/silver | Men's and women'’s
30 Dress Uniform Elbeco button and gold/silver metal hat snake. sizes. 12 $261.25 $3,135.00
Men's and women's
31 Shoes Bates E00941 & E00742 Duty Oxford sizes. 54 $56.26 $3,038.04
32 Badge Cover Mourning 1" black elastic band. 50 $0.50 $25.00
5.11 Tactical Professional Polo, S/S, color #724 dark navy, #016 heather or
33 Shirt Series 41060 #010 white. Medium - 3XL 40 $21.45 $858.00
5.11 Tactical Professional Polo, S/S, color #724 dark navy, #016 heather or
34 Shirt Series 410607 #010 white. Women's sizes S-XL 10 $23.55 $235.50
5.11 Tactical Professional Polo, S/S, color #724 dark navy, #016 heather or
35 Shirt Series 31140 #010 white, $21.45 $0.00
9.0 0z. navy, 1 color screen logo - white (lettering to be Men's and Women's
36 Sweatpants JERZ 4850MP provided by Fire Dept.) sizes. S - 5XL 60 $12.85 $771.00
9.3 0z., navy, 1 color screen logo - white (lettering to be | Men’s and Women's
37 Sweatshirt JERZ 4662M provided by Fire Dept.). sizes. S - 5XL 60 $10.90 $654.00
#405 navy, 100% nylon, 1 color screen logo - white on teft | Men's and Women's
38 Gym Short A-Game AG101M front (fettering to be provided by Fire. Dept.). sizes. S - 5XL 60 $14.50 $870.00
i 3.8 Cubic Feet Capacity; heavy duty coated nylon, "Fire N . .
American Fighter" woven in straps; reflective trim; shoulder strap; 29"x14"x16" (ouside
39 Gear Bag Firewear B8ORS screen printed Maltese Cross; outside name and card holder. dimensions) 50 No Bid No Bid
Break-away high visibility, lettering "FIRE" in silver reflective
40 Safety Vest Blauer 339F letters on both sides, badge tab. S-3XL 46 $36.00 $1,656.00
Techwear Fleece, dark navy. (Customer supplied patches to
41 Job Shirt Blauer 4600 be sewn on each sleeve). S-3XL 46 $47.70 $2,194.20
Mid Weight, pocket, navy short sleeve fire retardant
42 Shirt Drifire DF2-260-SSP performance wear. X8 - 3XL 46 No Bid No Bid
Excel-FR® ComforTouch® Flame resistant, 9 oz. twill 88% | RG 38-54 & LN 42-
43 Coveralls Bulwark.FR cotton 12% nylon, navy. Arc Rating ATPV 12.2 calories/cm? 52 46 $72.00 $3,312.00
44 Badge Biackinton B-1751R 4 Panel Reversed enamel,Rho-Glo Silver "Inspector” Inspector 1 $64.98 $64.98
4 Panel Reversed enamel, Rho-Glo Silver "Deputy Fire
45 Badge Blackington B 1751R Marshal" Deputy Fire Marshal 3 $64.98 $194.94
46 Badge Blackington B 1751R 4 Panel Reversed Enamel Hi-Glo Gold "Chief Deputy " Chief Deputy 1 $67.25 $67.25 -
No it it or i from the will be




FIRE DEPARTMENT
UNIFORM BID INFORMATION

PRICE QUOTE FORM

47 Badge Blackington B 1751R 4 Panel Reversed Enamel Hi-Glo Gold "Fire Marshal " Fire Marshat 1 $67.25 $67.25
48 Name Bar Blackington A 7159 Name Plates 1st Initial Last Name 1/2" 1 Line Gold & Silver 6 $11.00 $66.00
49 Collar Devices Blackington Ocean City Seal Collar Devices Clutch Back- Siiver & Gold Full Color 6 $12.35 $74.10
50 Beit Law Pro 6582 1.75 " Black leather Uniform Belt ‘8 $13.90 $111.20
51 Pants 5.11 Tactical | ADU Royal Robbins ADU Pants Black /Khaki 20 $33.05 $661.00
52 Pants Blauer 8821X Trouser 3X Dry Navy 32 $40.50 $1,296.00

' $65,718.23

No modifications or deviations from the above specifications will be accepted.

will be

from the



JOR

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
A Jacobs Graves Howard Uniform | Lawmen's Su
.05 $26.03 $26.40
.75 $23.81 $23.70
15 $24.24 $21.45
.35 $23.52 $23.45
7.95 $317.91 / 4X to 5X $365.60 No Bid
.50 $87.45 4X to 5X $100.53 No Bid
.55 $20.42 $20.40
.30 $32.34 / 4X to 5X $63.63 $26.45
45 $27.30/ 4X to 5X $53.11 $22.60
.00 $12.75/7/2X to 5X $17.14 $15.15
.05 $62.57 $50.25°
.35 $53.79 $56.25°
.40 $54.34 $43.35
.45 $42.78 $40.50
.50 $55.22 / Longer Rise $70.72 No Bid
.50 $31.53 No Bid
.50 $71.15/ Longs $75.01 $75.00
.00 $63.01 /7 4X to 5X $105.41 $48.50
.95 $45.99 / 4X to 5X $79.41 $58.50
.95 $72.99/ 4X to 5X $126.68 $62.00
1.75 $253.47 / 4X to 5X $440.96 $203.25
90 No Bid No Bid
3.30 $148.97 No Bid
50 $2.74 $3.45
60 $2.88 $3.50
.00 No Bid No Bid
.00 No Bid No Bid
.00 No Bid No Bid
.00 No Bid No Bid
.90 No Bid $24.15 $23.44° $25.80 No Bid $26.90
.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.20 No Bid $46.80
.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.25 No Bid $25.90
.90 No Bid $24.15 $23.44° $25.80 No Bid $26.90
.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.60 No Bid $14.40
20 $1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.99 No Bid
10 $1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.99 No Bid
00 $1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.99 No Bid
.25 $3.97 $4.00 $5.19 No Bid $3.99 No Bid
.55 $2.99 $4.00 $5.19 No Bid $3.99 No Bid




JOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
A Jacobs Graves Howard Uniform | Lawmen's Supply, Vero Beach, FL | Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ | Liberty Emblem Company LLC

Bid No Bid $10.40 No Bid $9.63 No Bid

Bid No Bid $11.40 No Bid $18.94 No Bid

.50 $24.33 No Bid No Bid $21.75 No Bid

.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.20 No Bid

25 $5.56 $4.25 $5.05 No Bid No Bid

.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.20 No Bid

.75 $48.06 No Bid No Bid $22.75 No Bid

.50 $59.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

.00 No Bid $77.25 $94.50 No Bid No Bid $122.65
.50 No Bid $25.00 $24.75 $11.40 No Bid $28.60
.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $78.70
50° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
.40 No Bid $14.50 $15.72 $14.95 No Bid $16.45
Bid No Bid $26.00 $31.12 $33.80 No Bid $37.15
Bid No Bid $8.50 $8.76 $6.44 No Bid $7.10
Bid No Bid No Bid $8.76 $12.35 No Bid $13.60
Bid No Bid $195.00 $168.71 $202.80 No Bid $222.85
3.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.40 No Bid $174.60
3.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.40 No Bid $174.60
3.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.40 No Bid $174.60
3.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.40 No Bid $174.60
5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $124.80 No Bid $187.20
5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $124.80 No Bid $187.20
5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $187.20
5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $187.20
3.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.40 No Bid $174.60
3.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.40 No Bid $174.60
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.25
.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.20
.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.65
40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Communications Uniform Bid Information
p and Esti dQ ti
item item Brand | _item Number i L
Men’s 30-46 even; 314
Men's Pant Land's End 17682-2N55 | Men’s Cargo Pant; 60% cotton/40% polyester 37 odd 12 $41.50 $498.00
Men's Pant Land's End 20317-8N55 | Men's Cargo Pant; 60% cotton/40% polyester | Men's 48-54 even 2 $46.50 $93.00
Men's Plain Front Chino Pant; Black; Men's 30-46 even; 314
Men's Pant Land's End 17682-1TN8 60%cotton/40% polyester 37 odd 4 $33.50 | $134.00
Men's Plain Front, Comfart Waist Chino Pant;
Men's Pant Land's End 20314-2TN8 60%cotton/40% polyester Men's Big 48-54 even] 2 No Bid $0.00
Men's Long Sleeve Butten Down Shirt; Single
Chest Pocket; 60% cotton/40% polyester, Men's Small -
Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07127-7TP5 Embroidery on left chest area, black thread XXLarge 6 $33.50 | $201.00
Men's Long Sleeve Button Down Shirt; Single
Chest Pocket; 60% cotton/40% polyester;
Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07504-8TP0 Embroidery on left chest area, black thread | Men's Big 2XL -5XL| 2 $33.50 $67.00
Men’s Long Sleeve Button Down Shirt; Single .
Chest Pocket; 0% cotton/40% polyester; Men's Big and Tall
Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07505 - 0TP8 Embroidery on left chest area, black thread 2XL - 5XL 2 $28.50 $57.00
Men's Short Sleeve Button Down Shirt; Single
Chest Pocket; 60% cotton/40% polyester; Men's Small -
Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07127-6TP0 Embroidery on left chest area, black thread XXLarge 6 $28.00 | $168.00
Men's Short Sleeve Button Down Shirt; Single
Chest Pocket; 60% cotton/40% polyester;
Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07505-3TP1 Embroidery on left chest area, black thread | Men's Big 2XL - 5XL| 2 $28.00 $56.00
Men's, Fine Gauge, V-Neck Sweater Vest;
100% cotton; Embroidery on left chest area,
Men's Sweater Vest Land's End 19787-5NNX grey thread Men's Medium - XXL| 2 $49.00 $98.00
Men's, Fine Gauge, V-Neck Sweater Vest;
100% cotton; Embroidery on left chest area,
Men's Sweater Vest Land's End 19787-6NN4 grey thread Men's Big 2XL-3XL 2 $48.50 $97.00
Men's Interlock Long Sleeve Mock Turtleneck;
Men's Mock 100% cotton: embroidery on left chest area,
Turtleneck Land's End 03864-4TPQ black or grey thread Men's Medium - XXL| 4 $27.50 $110.00
10/9/2009 Cost Sp t based on Quantity and Low Price Communications




10/9/2009

Communications Uniform Bid Information

Specifications and Estimated Quantities

Men's Small -
Men's T Shirt Land's End 24510-5N41 Men's Short Sleeve Super T, 100% cotton XXLarge 4 $19.50 $78.00
Men's T Shirt Land's End 06108-4N4X Men's Short Sleeve Super T; 100% cotton | Men's Big 2XL-3XL| 2 $16.50 $33.00
Men's Smail -
Men's T Shirt Land's End 24510-7N42 Men's Long Sleeve Super T; 100% cotton XXLarge 2 $20.50 $41.00
Women's Classic Straight Boot-Cut Chino
Women's Pant Land's End 19520-9N53 Pant; 60% cotton/40% polyester Women's 2 - 18 even| 20 $39.50 | $790.00
Women's Classic Straight Boot-Cut Chino | YWomen's 18W - 34W
Women's Pant Land's End 19521-1N54 Pant; 60% cotton/40% polyester even 2 $44.50 $89.00
Women's Modern Straight Boot-Cut Chino
Women's Pant Land's End 19524-4N54 Pant; 60% cotton/40% polyester Women's 2 - 18 even| 2 $39.50 $79.00
Women's Long Sleeve, button down shirt;
60% cotton/40% polyester; embroidery on left
Women's Oxford Shirtl Land's End 17737-9TP7 chest area, black thread Women's XS - XL 4 $28.50 $114.00
Women's Long Sleeve, button down shirt;
60% cotton/40% polyester; embroidery on left
Women's Oxford Shirtl  Land's End 17738-0TPX chest area, black thread Women's 1X - 5X 2 $28.50 $57.00
. Women's Short Sleeve, button down shirt;
60% cotton/40% polyester; embroidery on left
Women's Oxford Shirt Land's End 17738-1TP chest area, black thread Women's XS - XL 4 $23.00 $92.00
Women's Short Sleeve, button down shirt;
60% colton/40% polyester; embroidery on feft
Women's Oxford Shirt, Land's End 17738-2TP9 chest area, black thread Women's 1X - 5X 2 $27.00 $54.00
Men's Long Sleeve
Polo Land's End 029397-T66 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton Men's 2XL - 5XL 2 $35.00 $70.00
Men's Long Sleeve
Polo Land's End 029396-T60 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton Men's S-XXL 2 $31.00 $62.00
Men's Classic Fit
Banded Short Sleeve
Polo Land's End 029376-T61 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton Men's 2X - 5X 4 $30.50 $122.00
Cost Sp eet based on Quantity and Low Price Communicatiens




10/9/2009

Communications Uniform Bid Information

pecifications and Esti dQ iti

Men's Classic Fit
Banded Short Sleeve
Polo Land's End 029374-T60 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton Men's Tall M - XXL 4 $30.50 $122.00
Men's Classic Fit
Banded Short Sleeve|
Polo Land's End 029373-T65 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton Men's S - XXL 12 $24.50 $294.00
Women's Relaxed Fit
Banded Short Sleeve
Polo Land's End 074683-T66 Women's Mesh Polo;  100% Cotton Women's XS - XL 18 $24.50 $441.00
Women's Relaxed Fit
Banded Short Sleeve
Polo Land's End 074692-T65 Women's Mesh Polo;  100% Cotton Women's 1X - 5X 3 $28.51 $85.53
Women's Feminine Fif
Banded Short Sleeve
Polo Land's End 029385-T60 Women's Mesh Polo;  100% Cotton Women's XS - XL 6 $24.50 $147.00
Women's Feminine Fit
Banded Short Sleeve .
Polo Land's End 029390-T68 Women's Mesh Polo;  100% Cotton Women's 1X - 5X 3 $30.50 $91.50
Women's Feminine Fi
Long Sleeve Polo Land's End 029406-T63 Women's Mesh Polo;  100% Catton Women's XS - XL 12 $31.00 $372.00
Men's Long Sleeve V- Men's Performance Fine Gauge Sweater,
Neck Sweater Land's End 065651-T62 Acrylic/Nylon Men's 2XL - 3XL 6 $47.50 $285.00
Men's Long Sleeve V4 Men's Performance Fine Gauge Sweater;
Neck Sweater Land's End 065650-T67 Acrylic/Nylon Men's M - XXL 12 $42.50 | $510.00
Women's Long Sleeve Women's Performance Fine Gauge Sweater;
V-Neck Sweater Land's End 065659-T66 Acrylic/Nylon Women's S - XL 12 $42.50 $510.00
Women's Long Steev
Stretch Low V-Neck Women's Performance Fine Gauge Sweater;
Sweater Land's End 327090-T64 Cotton/Nylon/Spandex Women's XS - XL 12 $48.00 $576.00
Women's Traditional Women's Performance Chinos;
Elastic Back Chinos Land's End 176814-T63 Cotton/Polyester Women's2-18even| 4 $34.50 $138.00
Traveler Luggage
Duffel Land's End 346143-T62 Traveler Luggage Small 1 $44.50 $44.50

Cost

t based on

Quantity and Low Price Communications




Communications Uniform Bid Information

Specifications and Estimated Quantities

Traveler Luggage
Duffel Land's End 346148-T6X Traveler Luggage Large 1 $69.75 $69.75

Color #04-Navy, HM (hemmed to specific

Men's Pant Blauer 8821X lengths). Men's 32-38 6 $40.30 $241.80
Polo Shirt 5-11 Tactical 41060 Color Grey short sleeve professional polo LG - XLG 6 $21.45 $128.70
Polo Shirt 5-11 Tactical 42056 Color grey long sleeve professional polo LG - XLG 6 $25.70 $154.20

Size 30 - 46 even,
hemmed to specific
Men's Chino Pant Land's End 17681-9 MN R CS PLT Chino Pant 60-40 Blend lengths 6 $34.00 | $204.00

Size 30 - 46 even,
hemmed to specific
Men's Chino Pant Land's End 17681-9 MN R CS PLT Chino Pant 60-40 Blend lengths 6 $34.50 | $207.00

Size 30 - 46 even,
hemmed to specific
Men's Chino Pant Land's End 17681-9 MN R CS PLT Chino Pant 60-40 Blend lengths 6 $34.50 [ $207.00

Neck 15.5 - 17.5;
Men's L/S Shirt Land's End 349762NK2 MN R BD Hyde Park Oxford Dress Shirt sleeve 33 - 37 4 $24.50 $98.00

Neck 15.5 - 17.5;
Men's L/S Shirt Land's End 349762NK2 MN R BD Hyde Park Oxford Dress Shirt sleeve 33 - 37 4 $24.50 $98.00

Neck 15.5 - 17.5;
Men's L/S Shirt Land's End 349762NK2 MN R BD Hyde Park Oxford Dress Shirt sleeve 33 - 37 4 $24.50 $98.00

$8,382.98

10/9/2009 Cost Sp 1eet based on Esti d Quantity and Low Price Communications




FIRE DEPARTMENT
UNIFORM BID INFORMATION

PRICE QUOTE FORM

il
“open weave” 4.25 ounce poplin -
blend 65% Fortrel polyester/35%
combed cotton, fused convertible
collars, pleated wilined scalloped
fiaps with hook and loop closures,
long loose badge tab above left
pocket, feft pencil pocket, cross
stitched shoulder straps full lined Men's and
Dress Shirt Elbeco placket fronts, white badge tabs not women's No Bid $24.00 $23.25 $26.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TS SPIFITe FirE —
Kermel/FR Rayon Blend 50/50 5.2
oz. twill, dk navy (customer supplied Men's and
2 Shirt Btauer 8213 patches to be sewn on each women's No Bid $53.90 $65.72 $56.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7S Ehift, cotton biend, carer #12
gray, EM (customer supplied
paiches to be sewn on each Men's and
3 Shirnt Blauer 8910X. sleeve). women's No Bid $32.95 $40.75 $34.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
STS Shirt, Calton blend, color #2
white, EM {customer supplied
patches to be sewn on each Men's and
4 Shirt Blauer 8910X sleeve). women's No Bid $32.95 $40.75 $34.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SIS SNirt, cotton blerid, color #4
navy, EM {customer supplied
patches to be sewn on each Men's and
5 Shirt Blauer 8713x sleeve).E14 women's No Bid $29.75 $36.51 $29.70 No 8id

No Bid No Bid

Men's and
Color #04, navy, HM (hemmed to |Women's (including
6 Pant Blauer 8821X specific lengths). long rise/full cut) No Bid $40.30 $47.55 $40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fire Retardant Trousers
Kermel/FR rayon blend 50/50, 14.0

oz twill, dk navy. Hemmed to Men's and
7 Pant Blauer 8210 specific lengths. women's No Bid $87.20 $106.63 $91.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

o g
8.1 ounce heavyweight, pre-shrunk
coverseamed neck and shoulder-to-
shoulder tape double-needle
sleeves and bottom hem, full cut
dimensions, tagless, deep navy.
Ocean City Fire Dept lettering on
back - block lettering 3 lines total |
line outline white - red letters and Sm-XL $7.50
emblemAettering on front pocket XXL $9.75
8 T- Shirt Hanes Beefy-T H5190 .Note: Contact Fire Dept for Small - 3XL No Bid XXXL $10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
g ey

8.1 ounce heavyweight, pre-shrunk,
caverseamed neck and shoulder-to-|
shoulder tape, double-needle
sleeves and bottom hem, full cut
dimensions, tagless, white. Ocean
City Fire Dept lettering on back -
block lettering 3 lines total 1 outline

white - red lefters and Sm-XL $6.70
emblem/lettering an front pocket XXL. $8.65

9 T- Shirt Hanes Beefy-T H5190 Note Contact Fire Dept for Small - 3XL No Bid XXXL $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pocket T TUU% nng-spun coftor,

6.1 ounce heavyweight, pre-shrunk,
neck and shoulder-t

shoulder tape, double-needie

sleeves and bottamn hem, full cut
dimensions, tagless ash. Ocean
City Fire Dept lettenng on back -

block lettering 3 lines total 1 outline Sm-XL $7.05
white - red letters and XXL $9.25

10 T- Shirt Hanes Beefy T 5190 on front. Note: Small - 3XL No Bid XXXL $10.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Season Bomber Jacket, Color #4
navy, 1 patch sewn on left sleeve, 1 Men's and

patch sewn on right sleeve (patches| women's sizes,
1 Jacket Blauer 5409 supplied by Fire Dept.) plus tall No Bid $86.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ver, one line, black inlay. 21/2x 172 No Bid $7.70 $7.01 $8.95 $8.00 No Bid $6.97 No Bid

12 | Nametags | Blackinton J-1 Polished

13 | Nametags | Blackinton J-1 Polished gold, one || 21/2x172 No Bid $7.70 $7.01 $8.95 $8.00 No Bid $6.97 No Bid

No or it from the attached speci will be accepted.




City seal with silver border and Fire
Dept rocker {sample provided upon

FIRE DEPARTMENT
UNIFORM BID INFORMATION

PRICE QUOTE FORM

14 |Collar Devices| Blackinton request). No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.65 No Bid $27.99 No Bid
Silver, Rhaglo, individualty
numbered, black inlay, City Seat in
15 Badge Blackintan 8803 center. No Bid $50.00 $55.36 $54.00 $44.57 No Bid $59.08 No Bid
Gord, Higlo FIT,
numbered, black inlay, City Seal in
16 Badge Blackinton B803 - center. No Bid $50.00 $55.36 $54.00 $44.57 No Bid $59.98 No Bid
ErmeD b
Jacket wiliner - dark navy crosstech
membrane, ripstop nylon outershell
Zip out B warm fleece liner, patches
sewn on sleeves - department patch
on left sleeve - certification patch on Men's and $246.20 S-3X
right sleeve (patches suppliedby | women's sizes, $319.61 4X
17 Jacket Blauer 98452 Fire Dept.). plus tall No Bid $194.45 $553.41 5X $201.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 “ NFPA 1999 Quterwear
Supershell Jacket with Crosstech Men's and $317.15 8-3X
Fabric; navy/f yel, zip-out B.Warm | women's sizes, $411.85 4X
18 Jacket Blauer 98701 Fleece liner, illuniNite dk navy/f yel.| plus tall No Bid $250.50 $553.86 5X $259.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's and
Rain Pants - black with adjustable | Women's sizes,
18 Pant Blauer 134 waistband and cuffs. plus talt No Bid $32.35 $33.86 $32.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Regular rain gear 30, PVC Nylon,
Scotchhte™ an sleeves and back,
Ccean City Fire Dept reflective
UNS77-00-1/577 | transfer on back. Note: Contact Fire Men's and $55.00 Minimum
|20 | Rain Gear Neese AJ Dept for layout, lettering. women's sizes. No Bid Order of 10 $41.86° No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
21 Ties Clip on regular, black or navy. Regular No Bid $2.60 $2.74 $3.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 Ties Clip on regular, black or navy, Extra Long No Bid $2.50 $2.88 $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 |Collar Devices|{ Blackinton A-3614 Capt. 2 homs in gold circle. 15/16" No Bid $7.75 u‘&.u:vm:‘ No Bid $13.00 No Bid $14.99 No Bid
24 [Collar Devices| Blackinton A-2872 Deputy Chief, gol 15/16" No Bid $7.75 u:.uivn:‘ Ne Bid $13.00 No Bid $14.99 No Bid
25 |Collar Devices| Blackinton A-3574 Chief, gold. 15/16" No Bid $7.75 «Ah.a‘:snm_\ No Bid $13.00 No Bid $14.99 No Bid
| 26 |Collar Devices| Blackinton A-3613 Lieutenant, siiver. 15/16" No Bid $7.75 $14.81/paif’ No Bid $13.00 No Bid $14.99 No Bid
Commendation, blueiwhite/blue- $10.50 plus $4.00 $11.18 Sitver
27 Pins Blackington blue/rediblue~rediwhite/blue No Bid if numbers added $10.75 No Bid $9.15 Gold No Bid $9.89 No Bid
28 | White Gloves No Bid $1.85 $2.00 $3.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.95°
American flag pins, tie tack closure,
approx. 3/4" (sample provided upon
29 Pins request). No Bid $11.95 $1.99 No Bid $12.67 No Bid $0.99 No Bid
Dress Coat Style #13753, Dress
Trousers Style #E1360, L/S Shurt,
Style P877. New York Belf Hat,
navy, with gold/silver button and Men's and
30 |Dress Uniform| Elbeco goldssitver metal hat snake. women's sizes. $263.54 $261.25 $292.98 $305.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's and #941 $57.50 #941 $56.26 #941 $61.60
31 Shoes Bates £00941 & E00742 Duty Oxford women's sizes. $60.44 #742 $62.00 #742 $59.74 #742 $67.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 | Badge Cover Moumning 1" black elastic band. $1.34 $0.50 $1.15 $1.45 No Bid No Bid $0.59 $0.85
Professional Polo, S7S, color #724
5.11 Tactical dark navy, #016 heather or #010 S-XXL $21.45
33 Shirt Series 41060 white. Medium - 3XL $24.05 XXXL $23.55 $24.83 $24.00 No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid
Professional Polo, S/S, color #724
5.11 Tactical dark navy, #016 heather or #010
34 Shirt Series 410607 white. $24.05 $23.55 $27.87 $27.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Professional Polo, S/S, color #7124
5.11 Tactical dark navy, #0316 heather or #010
35 Shirt Series 31140 white. No Bid $21.45 $24.83 $24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No from the aftached will be accepted.




FIRE DEPARTMENT
UNIFORM BID INFORMATION

PRICE QJOTE FORM

9.0 0z. navy, 1 color screen logo - Men'’s and
white (lettering to be provided by |Women's sizes. S - $-XL $12.85
36 | Sweatpants JERZ 4850MP Fire Dept.) 5XL No Bid 2X-3X $15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9.3 0z. navy, 1 color screen logo - Men's and S-XL $10.90
white (lettering to be provided by |Women's sizes. S - 2X-3X $13.20
37 | Sweatshirt JERZ 4662M Fire Dept.). 5XL No Bid 4X $14.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#405 navy, 100% nylon, 1 color
screen logo - white on left front Men's and
(tettering to be provided by Fire. |Women's sizes. S S-XL $14.50
38 | GymsShort | A-Game AG101M Dept.). SXL No Bid XXL $15.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

T HTubic Feel Capadity; heavy duty|
coated nylon, “Fire Fighter” woven
in straps; reflective trim; shoulder 29"x14"x16"
American strap, screen printed Maltese Cross; (ouside
39| GearBag | Firewear BBORS outside name and card holder. dimensi No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 | Safety Vest Blayer 338F both sides badge tab. S-3XL No Bid $36.20 $38.64 $36.00 No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
Techwear Fleece, dark navy.

(Customer supplied patches to be

4

Job Shirt Blauer 4600 S-3XL No Bid $49.80 $53.28 $47.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

sleeve fire retardant performance
42 Shirt Drifire DF2-260-SSP wear. XS - 3XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EXCeFFR® Comfor T 6UCh® Flame

resistant 9 oz. twill 88% cotton 12%
nylon, navy, Arc Rating ATPV 12.2 |RG 38-54 & LN 42

43 Coveralls | Bulwark.FR 52 No Bid $74.45 No Bid $72.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Panel Reversed enamel Rho-Glo
44 Badge i B-1751R er "Inspector No Bid $67.25 $73.70 No Bid $64.98 No 8id $79.99 $95.00
4 Panel Reversed enamel Rho-Glo
45 Badge Biackington B 1751R Silver "Deputy Fire Marshal" | Deputy Fire Marshal No Bid $67.25 $73.70 No Bld $64.98 No Bid $79.99 $95.00
4 Panel Reversed Enamel Hi-Glo
46 Badge Blackington B 1751R Gold “Chief Deputy " Chief Deputy No Bid $67.25 $73.70 No Bid $64.98 No Bid $79.9% $119.00
4 Panel Reversed Enamel Hi-Glo
47 Badge Blacki B1751R Gold ‘Fire Marshal " Fire Marshal No Bid $67.25 $73.70 No Bid $64.98 No Bid $79.99 $119.00
Name Plates 1st Initial Last Name
48 Name Bar _ | Blackington A 7159 1/2" 1 Line Gold & Sitver No Bid $11.00 $11.00 No Bid No Bid $11.99 $18.50
Ocean City Seal Collar Devices
49 | Coltar Devices Clutch Back- Silver & Gald Full Color No Bid $12.35 Each $24.71/Pair No Bid $12.58 No Bid No Bid $31.00
S0 Belt Law Pro 6582 1.75 " Black leather Uniform Belt No Bid $13.90° No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 Pants 5.11 TacticalADU Royal Robbing ADU Pants Black /Khaki No Bid $33.05 $33.92 $36.00 Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
52 Pants Blauer 8821X Trouser 3X Dry Navy No Bid $41.30 $47.55 $40.50 No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid

* Bid Duty Man

® 10 Piece Minimum add $12,00 f ordering less than 10
< Cotton T T

814 81/pair s $7.405 each 1

No r from the attached witl be accepted.




Commuynicat ans Unform Bid Information

Prce Quote Form
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Men's Cargo Pant; 60% cottor40%
.l Menspant Land's End 17682-2N55 polyester No Bid $41.50 No Bid No Bid No No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's Cargo Pant; 60% catton/40%
2 Men’s Pant Land's End 20317-BNS5 polyester No Bid $46.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's Plain Front Chine Pant; Black;
3 Men's Pant Land's End 17682-1TN8 B0%cotton/d0% palyester No Bid $33.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
Men's Plain Front, Comfort Waist Chino
) Men's Pant Land's End 20314-2TN8 Part; 80%cotton/40% polyester No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's Long Sleeve Buttony Down Shirt;
ngle Chest Pocket; 60% cotton/40%
polyester Embroidery on left chest area,
S Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07127-7TP5 black thread No Bid $33.50 1 2X to 5X $39.50 No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men'’s Lang Sleeve Button Down Shil
Single Chest Pocket; 60% cotton/40%
polyester; Embroidery on left chest area,
6 Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07504-8TP0O black thread No Bid $33.50 / 2X to 5X $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men'’s Long Sleeve Button Down Shirt;
Single Chest Packet; 60% cotton/40%
polyester, Embroidery on left chest area,
7 Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07505 - QTP8 black thread No Bid $23.50 / 2X to 5X $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's Short Sleeve Button Down Shurt;
Single Chest Pocket; 60% cotton/d0%
polyester; Embroidery on left chest area,
8 Men's Oxford Shirt Land's End 07127-6TPO black thread No Big $28.00 / 2X to 5X $33.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's Short Sleeve Button Down Shurt;
Single Chest Pocket; 60% cotton/40%
polyester; Embroidery on left chest area,
9 Men's Oxford Shit Land's End 07505-3TP1 black thread No Bid $28.00 / 2X to 5X $33.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's, Fine Gauge V-Neck Sweater Vest:
Men's Sweater 100% cottory; Embroidery on left chest area
10 Vest Land's End 18787-5NNX grey thread No Bid $49.00 / 2X to 3X $53.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Neo Bid
Men's, Fine Gauge, V-Neck Sweater Vest;
Men's Sweater 100% cotton; Embroidery on left chest area
1 Vest Land's End 19787-6NN4 grey thread No Bid $48.50 1 2X to 3X $54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
Men's Interlock Long Sleeve Mack
Men's Mock Turtleneck; 100% cottan; embraidery on lef
12 Turtleneck Land's End 03864-4TPO chest area, black or grey thread No Bid $27.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id
13 Men's T Shirt Land's End 24510-5N41 Men's Short Sleeve Super T, 100% cotton Ne Bid $19.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 Men's T Shirt Land's End 06108-4N4X Men's Short Sleeve Super T; 100% cotton Na Bid $16.50/ 2X to 3X $23.50 No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 Men's T Shirt Land's End 24510-7N42 Men's Long Sleeve Super T, 100% cotton No Bid $20.50 / 2X to 3X $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Women's Classic Straight Boot-Cut Chino
18 Women's Pant Land's End 18520-ON53 Pant, 0% cotton/40% polyester No Bid $39.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid
Women's Classic Straight 8oot-Cut Chino
17 Women's Pant Land's End 19521-1N54 Pant; £0% cotton/40% polyester No Bid $44.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wemen's Modem Straight Boot-Cut Chino
18 Women's Pant Land's End 19524-4N54 Pant; 60% cotton/40% polyester No Bid $39.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Women's Long Sleeve, button down ehirt;
Women's Oxford 60% cottor/d0% polyester; embroidery on
19 Shirt Land's End 17737-9TP7 left chest area, black thread No Bid $28.50 1 1XL to SXL $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Women's Long Sleeve, button down shitt;
‘Women's Oxford 60% cotton/40% polyester; embroidery on
20 Shirt Land's End 17738-07PX left chest area, black thread No Bid $28.50 1 1XL to SXL $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10/972009
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Communications Uniform Bid Information

Price Quote Form
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Women'’s Short Sleeve, button down shut;

Women's Oxford 60% cotton/40% polyester; embroidery on

21 Shuit Land's End 17738-1TP left chest area, black thread No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Women's Short Sleeve, buttan down shirt;
Women's Oxford 60% cotton/40% polyester. embroidery on

22 Shirt Land's End 17738-2TPS left chest area, black thread No Bid $27.00 / 1XL to SXL $33.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid

Men's Long Sleeve,
23 Polo Land's End 029397-T66 Men's Mesh Pola 100% Cotton Ne Bid $35.00 No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Men's Long Sleeve,
24 Polo Land's End 029396-T60 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid

Men's Classic Fit
Banded Short
25 Sleeve Polo Land's End 029376-T61 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton No 8id $30.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Men's Classic Fit
Banded Short -
26 Sleeve Polo Land's End 029374-T60 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton No Bid $30.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Men's Classic Fit
Banded Short
27 Sleeve Polo Land's End 029373-T65 Men's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton Na Bid $24.50 $47.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Women's Relaxed
Fit Banded Short
28 Sleeve Polo Land's End 074683-T66 Women's Mesh Polo:  100% Cotton No Bid $24.50 $24.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Women's Relaxed
Fit Banded Short
29 Sleeve Polo Land's End 074692-T65 Women's Mesh Polo;  100% Cotton No Bid $30.50 $28.51 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid

Women's Feminine|
Fit Banded Short

30 Sleeve Polo Land's End 029385-T60 Women's Mesh Polo, 100% Cotton Na Bid $24.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
Women's Feminine|
Fit Banded Short
3 Sleeve Polo Land's End 029390-768 Women's Mesh Polo 100% Cotton No Bid $30.50 No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
‘Women's Feminine|
Fit Long Sleeve
32 Polo Land's End 029406-T63 Women's Mesh Polo; 100% Cotton No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men’s Long Sleeve| Men'’s Performance Fine Gauge Sweater;
33 V-Neck Sweater Land's End 065651-T62 Acrylic/Nylon No Bid $47.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Men's Long Sleeve Men's Performance Fine Gauge Sweater:
V-Neck Sweater Land's End 065650-T67 AcrylicNylon No Bid $42.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
Women's Lang
Sleeve V-Neck Women's Performance Fine Gauge Sweater;
5 Sweater Land's End 065659-766 Acrylic/Nylan No Bid $42.50 No Bid No Bid Na Bid Ne Bid Na Bid No Bid
Women's Long
Sleeve Stretch Lo Women's Performance Fine Gauge Sweater;
36 V-Neck Sweater. Land's End 327090-T64 Cotton/Nylon/Spandex No Bid $48.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Women's
Traditional Elastic Women's Performance Chines;
37 Back Chinos Land's End 176814-T63 Cotton/Polyester Ne Bid $34.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Brd No Bid
Traveler Luggage
38 Duffel Land's End 346143-T62 Traveler Luggage Ne Bid $44.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Traveler Luggage
39 Duffel Land's End 346148-T6X Traveler Luggage Na Bid $69.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

101972009 Bid Resuk Spreadsheet FY2010 Communicat ons Jniforms.




Communications Uniform Bid Information

Prce Quote Form

Color #04 Navy HM (hemmed to specific

) Men's Pant Blauer 8821X fengths). No Bid $4030 No Bid $49.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
“ Polo Shirt 5-11 Tactical 41060 Color Grey short sleeve ional pola No Bid $21.45 No 8id $26.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
@ Polo Shirt 5-11 Tactical 42056 Color grey long sleeve prefessional pola No Bid $25.70 No Bid $20.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43| Men's Chino Pant| Land's €nd 17681-9 MN R CS PLT Chino Pant 60-40 Blend No Bid $34.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44__| Men's Chino Pant| _Land's End 17681-9 MN R CS PLT Chino Pant 60-40 Blend No Bidt $34.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
45__| Men's Chino Pant| Land's End 17681-9 MN R CS PLT Chino Pant 60-40 Blend No Bid $34.50 No Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id No 8id No Bid
4 | Men's US Shirt Land's End 349762NK2 MN R BO Hyde Park Oxford Dress Shirt No Bid $24.50 No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
a7_| Men's US Shit Land's End 349762NK2 MN R BD Hyde Park Oxford Dress Shirt No Bid $24.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 | Men's LS Shit Land's End 349762NK2 MN R BD Hyde Park Oxford Dress Shirt No Bid $24.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10/9/2009
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TO:

INTERDEPARTMENTAL MEMO

Dennis Dare, City Manager

FROM: Joe Sobczak, General Services Director

DATE: October 9, 2009

SUBJECT: Uniform Bid Awards

Attached are the spreadsheets for the uniform bids with the low bidders noted. The using departments

have reviewed the low bids for conformity to their bid specs. In all cases except as noted the low bidder did
meet the bid specifications.

I recommend that the bid be awarded as follows:

Police Department
Atlantic Tactical, New Cumberland, PA
Items: 15, 24, 25, 54, 58, 59, 62, 64, 66, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79
F & F & A Jacobs, Baltimore, MD
Items: 1,2,4,5,6,7,8,9,10,11% 12, 14, 16, 17, 21, 22, 23, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 33, 43, 44, 45,
46, 47, 48, 49, 56, 60, 63, 80, 82
Graves Uniforms, Lewes, DE
Items: 19, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42,
Howard Uniform Company Baltimore, MD
Items: 3, 13, 18, 20, 51, 53, 65
Lawmen’s Supply, Vero Beach, FL
Items: 67
Lawmen Supply Company of New Jersey, Dover, DE
Items: 31, 32, 34, 50, 52, 55, 57, 61
Marvyland Police Supply, Baltimore, Maryland
Items: 81
*Rejected low bidder Howard Uniform they did not bid requested item.

Fire Department, Emergency Services, and Fire Marshal
F & F & A Jacobs, Baltimore, Maryland
Items: 2,3,4,6,7,8,9,10,11, 17, 18, 19, 21, 22, 28, 30, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 46, 47, 48,
49, 50, 51
Graves Uniforms, Lewes, DE
Items: 1,20, 23, 24, 25, 26, 31
Howard Uniform Company, Baltimore, Maryland
Items: 5,40, 41, 43, 52
Lawmen’s Supply, Vero Beach, FL
Items: 14, 15, 16, 44, 45
Liberty Emblem Company. Eldersburg. MD
Items: 12, 13,27, 29,




Communications

F&F&A Jacobs Uniforms, Baltimore, MD
Items: 1,2,3,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27,
28, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48

Graves Uniforms, Lewes, DE
Items: 29

The estimated budget allocation for this purchase was $310,000.00; the estimated calculated expenditure
based on the low prices noted above and the estimated quantity to purchase as projected by the individual
departments will be $259,358.37. This purchase, based on the estimated quantities given, will be $50,641.63
below the budget allocation.

The using departments (Police/Fire/Emergency Services) have taken a second look at their uniform needs. This
expenditure represents the quantities required after review.




FY2010 POLICE UNIFORM BID

Estimated Quantity Price/Unit Total Projected Cost
1.ShirtL/S Elbeco, White 3110/9310 80 $25.05 $2,004.00
2.5hirtS/S Elbeco, White 3310/9810 80 $22.75 $1,820.00
3.L/Sleeve Navy Mock Turtleneck - Blauer 200 $21.45 $4,290.00
4.ShirtL/S Elbeco, Lt Blue (Paragon Plus) 80 $22.35 $1,788.00
5.Jacket, Olympic - Bike 40 $237.95 $9,518.00
6. Shirts, Bike (Black/Royal Blue) - Qlympic 200 $58.50 $11,700.00
7.Shirt, Elbeco, short-sleeve, It blue (Paragon Plus) 80 $19.55 $1,564.00
8. Shirt, Blauer, Long Sleeve Navy - Classact 200 $26.30 $5,260.00
9. Shirt, Blauer, Short Sleeve Navy 200 $22.45 $4,490.00
10. Shirt, Ulitmate Outer Banks Polo 120 $12.00 $1,440.00
11. Pants, Flying Cross/Fechheimer, summer 80 $59.05 $4,724.00
12. Pant, Flying Cross/Fechheimer, winter 80 $50.35 $4,028.00
13. Pants, Blauer Street Wear with side pockets 200 $43.35 $8,670.00
14. Pants, Blauer Street Wear with outside pockets 90 $39.45 $3,550.50
15. Shorts, 8" cycling (Olympic) with pad 300 $49.90 $14,970.00
16. Padded Compression Shorts 100 $21.50 $2,150.00
17. Cycling Pants - Supplex Approach (Mocean) - Black w/pad 100 $68.50 $6,850.00
18. Sweater, Blauer Navy 210/V-Neck 60 $48.50 $2,910.00
19. Sweater, Blauer Navy 225/V-Neck 50 $45.99 $2,299.50
20. Sweater, Women's Navy - Blauer - Zipper Front 30 $62.00 $1,860.00
21. Jacket, Blauer lke Length - Navy 60 $197.75 $11,865.00
22 .Raincoat, Rainfair, Yellow 80 $9.90 $792.00
23 Raincoat, Flying Cross, Reversible Biack/HV Yellow 80 $133.30 $10,664.00
24. Tie, Clip-On, Regular, Black 50 $2.19 $109.50
25. Tie, Clip-On, Extra-Long, Black 30 $2.30 $69.00
26.Hat, Bayly, Solid, Winter 60 $32.00 $1,920.00
27. Hat, Bayly, Mesh, Summer 100 $32.00 $3,200.00
28. Hat, Rain Cover, Vinyl (price per dozen) 150 $28.00 $4,200.00
29. Hat, Bayly Mesh Cover 100 $14.00 $1,400.00




Estimated Quantity Price/Unit Total Projected Cost
30.Belt, Garrison, Silver Buckle 10 $13.90 $139.00
31. Belt, Bianchi, Nylon Sam Brown 50 $31.20 $1,560.00
32. Belt, Bianchi, Nylon Underbelt 50 $17.25 $862.50
33. Belt, Garrison, Gold Buckle 10 $13.90 $139.00
34. Belt Keeper, Bianchi Nylon (price/4 pack) 200 $9.60 $1,920.00
35.Stripes, SGT, Blue/Black (price per pair) 100 $1.34 $134.00
36.Stripes, CPL, Blue/Black (price per pair) 100 $1.34 $134.00
37. Stripes, PFC, Blue/Black (price per pair) 100 $1.34 $134.00
38.Collar Pins, Gold Captain (price per pair) 10 $3.97 $39.70
39.Collar Pins, Gold Lieutenant (price per pair) 20 $2.99 $59.80
40.Chevrons, Collar, SGT, Premier (price per pair) 24 $3.93 $94.32
41.Chevrons, Collar, CPL, Premier (price per pair) 50 $3.93 $196.50
42.Chevrons, Collar, PFC, Premier {price per pair) 50 $3.93 $196.50
43.Name tag, Blackington, Silver 200 $10.05 $2,010.00
44.Shirt Stays - Black with Stirrup 100 $6.50 $650.00
45.Name Tag, Blackington, Gold 30 $10.05 $301.50
46.Pins, Commendation, Blackington w and w/o #'s A3705 200 $8.75 $1,750.00
47.Pins, Commendation, Blackington w and w/o #'s A3704 200 $8.75 $1,750.00
48.Pins, Silver Star, Blackington 20 $8.75 $175.00
49.Pins, Assorted, Blackington w and w/o #'s 200 $8.75 $1,750.00
50. MSI Oleoresin Capsicum Spray MK-9 Magnum 5.5% 12 $36.23 $434.76
51.0C Spray Case for MK-9 Aerosol, Nylon 12 $10.80 $129.60
52.MSI Oleoresin Capsicum Spray MK-VI 5.5% 400 $9.63 $3,852.00
53.0C Spray Case for MK-VI Aerosol, Black Leather 100 $11.40 $1,140.00
54.Handcuffs, Smith & Wesson, Nickel 50 $20.04 $1,002.00
55.Handcuff Case, Bianchi Nylon 50 $16.20 $810.00
56.Handcuff Keys, Oversized, 3 Inch Length 100 $4.25 $425.00
57.Magazine Pouch Double, Bianchi Nylon 50 $22.20 $1,110.00
58.Gloves, HATCH Winter Specialist 75 $19.35 $1,451.25
59.Ansi 207-2006 Traffic Vest/Police & Ocean City Logo 150 $46.58 $6,987.00

Estimated Quantity Price/Unit Total Projected Cost




60.Streamlight - Stinger XT Flashlight w/Traffic Cone 12 $25.00 $300.00
61.Streamlight - Stinger - Ballistic Nylon Holder 25 $11.40 $285.00
62.Monadnock Detective 26 Baton - Friction Expandable 75 $48.28 $3,621.00
63.Bike Gloves - Body Geometry Comp/Men's & Women's 60 $19.50 $1,170.00
64.Battery, Stinger XT- Replacement 40 $14.38 $575.20
65.Battery, SL-20 XP - Replacement 30 $26.00 $780.00
66.Bulbs, Flashlight Replacement, Stinger XT 20 $4.86 $97.20
67.Bulbs, Flashlight Replacement SL-20 XP 20 $8.76 $175.20
68.Five Bank SL-20 XP LED Charger 2 $163.72 $327.44
69. Holsters, Safariland, Security for Sig Pro 2340 R/H 070 20 $98.61 $1,972.20
70. Holsters, Safariland, Security for Sig Pro 2340 L/H 070 8 $98.61 $788.88
71. Holsters, Safariland, Security for Sig Compact 239 R/H 6 $98.61 $591.66
72. Holsters, Safariland, Security for Sig Compact 239 L/H 6 $98.61 $591.66
73. Holsters, Safariland, Security for Sig Pro 2340 R/H 6070 25 $91.01 $2,275.25
74. Holsters, Safariland, Security for Sig Pro 2340 L/H 6070 8 $91.01 $728.08
75. Holsters, Safariland, Security for Sig Compact 239 R/H 8 $91.01 $728.08
76. Holsters, Safariland, Security for Sig Compact 239 L/H 8 $91.01 $728.08
77. Holsters, Safariland, Secuirty for S&W 4" Revolver R/H 25 $98.61 $2,465.25
78. Holsters, Safariland, Security for S&W 4" Revolver L/H 5 $98.61 $493.05
79. Radio Cases, Bianchi, Universal Fit 25 $22.64 $566.00
80. CPR Masks - MDI Complete Kit 100 $10.25 $1,025.00
81. CPR Masks - MDI Refill Kits 200 $7.65 $1,530.00
82. Drug Evidence Bags (MSP Approved: KAPAK) 5000 $0.40 $2,000.00

$185,257.16




