January 18, 2011
Regular Session #2
Mayor and Council
Town of Ocean City

Council Member Richard W. Meehan Council Member Margaret Pillas
Council President James S. Hall Council Member Mary Knight
Council Secretary Lloyd Martin Council Member Doug Cymek

Council Member Joe Hall
Council Member Brent Ashley

ATTENDANCE

City Manager Dennis Dare, City Solicitor Guy Ayres, Finance Administrator Martha Lucey, City Clerk
Kathleen Mathias, Private Events Coordinator Lisa Mitchell, Special Programs/Grants Coordinator
Wayne Pryor, City Engineer Terry McGean, Members of the Press and Interested Parties.

CALL TO ORDER
Council President Jim Hall called this Regular Session to order at 6:00 p.m., in the Council Chambers
of City Hall, 301 Baltimore Avenue, Ocean City, Maryland 21842.

PRAYER & PLEDGE
Council Member Knight led the prayer and Council Member Cymek led the Pledge of Allegiance.

REPORT FROM CITY MANAGER ON UPCOMING WORK SESSION

City Manager Dare advised there will be no work session next week. [The next scheduled work
session is on February 1, 2011.]

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

A. Work Session — December 14, 2010 were approved as presented.
B. Regular Session #24 dated December 20, 2010 were approved as presented.

PRIVATE EVENT PERMIT REQUESTS
A. USLA Mid-Atlantic Regional Championships — Wednesday, July 13, 2011
Presented by: Lisa Mitchell, Private Events Coordinator and Ryan Cowder, USLA
Council Member Knight moved to approve; seconded by Council Member Pillas. The
vote was unanimous.

B. 13" Annual Mitch Maiorana Memorial Run-Swim-Run — Saturday, July 23, 2011
Presented by: Lisa Mitchell, Private Events Coordinator and Ryan Cowder, USLA

Council Member Knight moved to approve; seconded by Council Secretary Martin. The
vote was unanimous.
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C. Beach 5 Sand Soccer Series — June 25 - 26, 2011
Presented by: Lisa Mitchell, Private Events Coordinator and William Harte

Private Events Coordinator Lisa Mitchell advised that City Staff requests the following
prior to the event: (1) must acquire and submit an insurance certificate; (2) must acquire
tent permit; (3) must attend a pre-event meeting with public works and beach patrol; (4)
must designated an on site contact person; (5) must ensure the site’s cleanliness at all
times; (6) must ensure that the Dorchester Street ramp, walkways and tram lane remain
free and clear of participants and spectators (7) no loading/unloading before 8:00 a.m. or
after 7:00 p.m. Council Member Ashley moved to approve; seconded by Council
Member Knight. The vote was unanimous.

D. Delmarva Bike Week 2011 — September 15 - 18, 2011
Presented by Private Events Coordinator Lisa Mitchell and Clifford Sutherland
Parks and Recreation Director Tom Shuster, Public Works Director Hal Adkins and Special
Events Director John Sullivan reported on the Town’s costs for the event (estimated at
$134,000.00) which includes: (1) tent set-up, (2) lost revenue for inlet parking, and (3)
labor. Mayor Rick Meehan said that, between Memorial Day and Labor Day, no events
should occupy inlet parking lot.
¢+ John Gehrig said the Council should support this Bike Week event.
¢ Jerry Albright suggested holding the event the week after Sunfest.
¢ Susan Jones of the HMRA endorsed Mr. Sutherland, and said the event will benefit
the Town in room and food taxes.
¢+ Ellie Diegelmann suggested that the Council delay their decision pending more
information.
OCPD Lieutenant Scott Harner said this event will require maximum staffing to meet
traffic demands and crowd control. Also, every year, right after Labor day, staffing is
reduced to wintertime levels so, for this event, overtime will be required. Council

Member Joe Hall moved to meet with city staff and the coordinator, during a Special
Session next Tuesday (January 25, 2011) to discuss cost and revenue sharing; seconded

by Council Member Knight. The vote was 6-1 with Council Member Jim Hall opposed.

NEW BUSINESS

Special Programs/Grants Coordinator Wayne Pryor reported on the FY2010 Homeland Security
Grants (see Attachment A). Council Member Knight moved to approve the grant allocations as
presented; seconded by Council Member Cymek. The vote was unanimous.

ITEMS REFERRED TO AND PRESENTATIONS FROM THE CITY MANAGER
City Manager Dare presented the following:

A. Upcoming Bid Openings — (1) Grass mowing services contract; (2) Asphalt Overlay for
Northside Park Pathway; (3) Fire Department Uniforms and Equipment. Council Secretary
Martin moved to approve; seconded by Council Member Knight. The vote was 6-0 with
Council Member Pillas out of the room.
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B. Recommendation of Bid Award for Medical Supplies as presented on Attachment B. Council

Member Knight moved to approve; seconded by Council Secretary Martin. The vote was
unanimous.

C. Recommendation for copier lease program award to Ricoh, in the amount of $27,193.56 per
year for five years, and, award the support contract to Ricoh in the amount of $ .007 per
page. Council Member Knight moved to approve; seconded by Council Member Cymek. The
vote was unanimous.

Unscheduled Discussion

o,

¢ City Manager Dennis Dare advised the Council that Corporal Dennis Eade was named the Officer
of the Year.

%+ City Clerk Kathleen Mathias presented, for approval, the transfer of Taxi Medallion #120 from
Taha Bourgo of Academy Taxi to Magid Osman of X Magic Taxi, (a new Independent taxi Owner).
for $2,000.00 and the $500.00 transfer fee was paid. She advised that Academy Taxi is still a fleet
— holding two remaining medallions. She added that the ratio of Fleet to Independent Medallions
isat 17% (15% and above is required). Council Secretary Martin moved to approve; seconded
by Council Member Knight. The vote was unanimous.

K/

%+ Council President Hall announced that on Tuesday, January 25, 2011, a Work Session will be held
to discuss Bike Week, and, a closed session will be held at 10:30 a.m. to conduct collective
bargaining negotiations or consider matters that relate to the negotiations.

+* Mayor Meehan advised that before 5:00 p.m. today, he delivered the following response to

eleven of the twelve ordinances ratified in the Regular Session of January 3, 2011.

» 2010-37 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (Pay grade changes require notification from the City Manager). He said he did not
veto this ordinance.

» 2010-38 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (Elimination of the Achievement Compensation for Excellence Award Program).
He did not veto but asked the Council to reconsider this program in the future.

» 2010-39 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (Automatic anniversary, COLA and step raises eliminated and granted with
Council’s approval during the annual budget process.) He said he did not veto this ordinance.

» 2010-45 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (ICMS 457 deferred compensation match eliminated for new hires). He said he did
not veto this ordinance because it does not totally eliminate the program.

» 2010-40 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (Eliminates the 5™ week of vacation for current employees, eliminates dependent
life, changes ICMA match to $200, reduces holidays from 12 to 11). The Mayor said he stated,
“| believe the intent of the council was to eliminate the fifth week of vacation for new
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employees and for those currently employed that are not yet qualified to receive this benefit.
The way this ordinance is currently written it "takes away" the benefit from those that have
already earned, and are currently receiving, this benefit. | would support what | believe was
the original intent and that is to eliminate the fifth week of vacation for new employees and
those current employees that have not as yet qualified to receive this benefit. | also believe
that the paid dependent life benefit is a valued benefit for our lower grade employees at a
total cost to the town of approximately S3800 per year. The cumulative effect of this change,
when combined with other proposed changes to employee salaries and benefits, significantly
reduces the value of the employee benefit package at very little savings to the taxpayers. |
believe it is in the best interest of our citizenry and employees to retain the paid dependent life
benefit.”

» 2010-41 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (Salary scheduled based upon 2005 Hendrick’s Study Chart — no movement in cap
without approval of Mayor and City Council). The Mayor stated, “Although | do support a
revised salary structure for new hires | do not support an arbitrary across the board decrease
in salaries of 8.5% for new hires using the 2005 Hendricks Study Chart as the basis. Times have
changed and we need to make reasonable and responsible changes to our pay scale that
reflects today's market conditions. Comparables from governing bodies and businesses on the
Eastern Shore, provided to the Mayor and Council by the Director of Human Resources,
indicate that our pay scale for the lower level employees is generally in line with the market
area. It is the middle to upper level salary structure that is above the average for our region. |
had asked that this issue be remanded to a Work Session for additional discussion at both 1St
and 2nd reading of this ordinance and my request was denied. | believe that a graduated
scale, with minimal changes to the lower level employees and increased changes as we move
up the pay scale, would more accurately follow the information we have been provided and
accomplish the goal of the council. | also believe that it is irrational to consider, or assume,
that a current employee would accept a pay cut if promoted. This is not a best management
practice and would not only affect current employees but also seasonal employees. This would
make it extremely difficult to develop leadership or supervisory positions in seasonal
operations, using the beach patrol as just one example.”

» 2010-42 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (New employees allowed ten days for personal, sick or bereavement leave.
Maximum accrual of 20 days and unused accrued days not permitted to retirement
enhancement). The Mayor stated, “Ordinance 2010 -42 gives the employee 8 additional days
of personal leave per year, which they will take or lose. This will actually encourage employees
to take additional time off, without notice, which may result in scheduling difficulties and, in
some cases, additional overtime expenses. The ordinance also does not allow sufficient time
off for those valued employees that suffer from unexpected long -term illness. | would
respectively request that Council President Hall remand this issue to a future work session for
additional discussion.”

» 2010-43 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (Retiree health coverage is eliminated for new hires). The Mayor stated,
“Ordinance 201043 eliminates retiree health coverage for new hires as of the enactment of
this ordinance. The Post - Employment Medical Benefits Actuarial Valuation, as required by
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GASB 45, and prepared by Bolton Partners, Inc for the Town of Ocean City on January 11, 2011
reports that the cost of this change in the first year will be an additional $810,000. | had
requested that this ordinance be tabled until we had the opportunity to meet again with
Bolton Partners, Inc at our Work Session scheduled for February 1, 2011, but this request was
denied. | believe that it is essential that we have a true understanding of how this change
affects the yearly costs associated with the funding of our current plan. | also believe that
there are other ways for us to make changes to this benefit that need to be considered before
making this radical change. Modifying the benefit over time, increasing the percentage paid
by the employee as costs go up, establishing a bridge to Medicare, and establishing a flat
dollar rate fixed at today's cost are just a few possible changes that could be considered.”

» 2010-44 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (Maximum of 3 weeks vacation earned for new hires). Mayor Meehan stated, “/
believe that not allowing new employees to earn a second week of vacation until after
completing 5 years of service to the Town of Ocean City is not a best management practice or
public policy. This is an inferior benefit that would become an impediment to recruitment and
retention of city employees. Our employees are called upon to make sure our city operates
efficiently 24 hours a day and expands from a base population of less than 20,000 to over
300,000 a day on any given weekend during our summer season. It is contrary to our
fundamental values as a family resort not to allow our employees to enjoy the same time off
with their families as the 8 million visitors we invite to Ocean City each year. The maximum
number of 3 weeks vacation that can be earned by long standing employees is also a concern
however | do agree with reducing that maximum from the current 5 weeks to 4 weeks.”

» 2010-46 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to Certain Municipal
Employees (Retirement plan for new hires will be a defined contribution plan). The Mayor
stated, “/ am in complete favor of having on going discussions to re- evaluate our current
pension plan for new hires in Ocean City. | do; however, believe it is irresponsible to pass this
type of ordinance until such time as we meet with our actuaries to get a true understanding of
how these proposed changes would effect the funding of our current plan and the level of
benefits future employees can expect to receive. | have asked that this ordinance be tabled, at
both first and second reading, until such time as these issues can be addressed and my request
was denied on both occasions. It is my understanding that a meeting with our actuaries is
scheduled for the Feb. 1, 2011 Work Session of the Mayor and Council and | believe that it
would be in the best interest of our employees, and our citizenry, to wait until after these
discussions take place before we initiate any changes to our current plan. It is my hope that
we can have further discussions on this issue and make reasonable and fiscally responsible
decisions that will benefit our taxpayers and provide sufficient and competitive benefits for
our valued future employees.”

» 2010-48 Amending Compensation or Benefits Paid or Provided to certain Municipal
Employees (Establishes cost sharing ratio for health insurance for new hires as follows: HMO
Coverage 90/10 co-share employee and 80/20 co-share dependent less individual costs, PPO
Coverage 85/15 co-share employee and 75/25 co-share dependent less individual costs.) The
Mayor said, Ordinance 2010 -48 changes the cost of health insurance benefits for dependents
from the Town s shared coverage on March 23, 2010 of 90%/10% to 75%/25% for the
preferred provider option. Under the Health Care Reform Act, as explained by Bolton
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Consultants at the Work Session on November 30, 2010, this change would cause the town to
lose its "grand-fathered" status: A decrease by an employer in its contribution rate towards
the cost of any tier of coverage for any class of similarly situated individuals by more than 5 %
below the employer's contribution rate for the coverage period that included March 23, 2010.
While it is anticipated that new hires could contribute an additional 510,000 to 520,000 for
their family coverage, losing the "grand fathering" status would increase Town costs a net
$130,000 to $140,000 in fiscal year 2012, as the Town would be required to now provide first
dollar coverage for preventative care, per our consultant, at an estimated cost of $150,000.”

+* Kevin Kirstein addressed the Council to announce that Corporal Dennis Eade was just named
Officer of the Year.

COMMENTS FROM CITIZENS

Patti Miller said she is encouraged that the Council will work together to resolve differences.

COMMENTS FROM THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL
Council Member Knight asked the Council to address the inlet parking lot policy in an upcoming work
session.

ADJOURNMENT
Council Secretary Martin moved to adjourn; seconded by Council Member Pillas. The vote was
unanimous.

Minutes prepared by Deputy City Clerk Kelly Allmond

Minutes certified by City Clerk Kathleen Mathias

Meetings approved by the Mayor and Council on:
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ATTACHMENT A l

FY 2010 Homeland Security
Grant

Town of Ocean City
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Agenda

#*FY 2010 Homeland Security Grant
# Review SHSGP grant’s background
#* Establish Strategic goals

# Summarize & Evaluate

#FY 2010 Budget to MEMA




Overview

# 2003 Ocean City completes its
Homeland Security Assessment &
Strategy

# Capabilities outlined and needs
established

#* Critical Infrastructure identified




Potential Targets

# Beach
#* Boardwalk

#* \Vater & Waste
Water Plants

# Convention Center
# City Bus System

» City Hall

# Public Safety
Building

#* Alrport

# Special Events




Capabilities

# Review of all City’s response personnel

Reviewed Emergency response equip

o]
FH
b Sy

Evaluated Training

# Examined Planning capabilities




Activities

# Generate Needs Assessment
Equipment

Training

Planning

o]
FH
r i

Utilize Homeland Security grant
funding to address Ocean City’'s n




Summarize

# Since 2003 nearly $4.2 million covering
35 Homeland Security grants has been
awarded to Ocean City.

# Many of the needs identified in the initial
vulnerablility assessment have been
addressed.




Next Steps

# Opportunity to re-evaluate our
Homeland Security direction

Continue to update our Needs
assessment

Use grant funding to address arevis
strategy

Submit FY 2010 project budget to ME




% Foundation of Emergency
Management

# Mitigation — “to make less severe”

# Preparedness - Planning, Training &
Education

# Response — Communications, Equipment,
Supplies

# Recovery — Resource agencies, Mutual Aid
agreements, Private Sector assistance




he?
éﬁ‘@ Strategic Goals

#* All —-Hazards approach
#* Protect City’s Critical Infrastructure

# Ensure Continuity of Government &
Operations — COOP

# Strengthen Response & Recovery
# Maintain Communications




Questions

# Have we developed a Culture of
Preparedness ?

# Have we built trust through collaborati
and partnerships ?

# Do we have an “all-hazards” approach

# Do we work as an Integrated Response
Team ?

#* Are we flexible ?




FY 2010 Considerations

#* COOP Storage
Area Network

# Survelllance
Cameras

* Emergency
Management
Planner

$318,443

# Variable Message
Boards

* HAZMAT
Response

# Bomb Squad
Vehicle

# Pan Disruptor




FY 2010 Grant

# 36 months to execute

#* Supplemental EMPG award of
$77,624 to offset Emergency
Management expenses

# Citizen Corps component - $2,797







ATTACHMENT B

Ocean City, MD

All-America City

{1

2001

MEMORANDUM

DATE: 1-5-11

TO: Dennis Dare, City Manager

FROM: Joe Sobczak, General Services Director

SUBJECT: Emergency Services and Beach Patrol Medical Supply Award

Lt. Chris Shaffer and | have reviewed the bids for medical supplies and in all instances
the bidder noted is the low bidder meeting the specifications.

Emergency Services Medical Supply
Alliance Medical, Jefferson City, MO
#24, 61, 119, 120, 121, 122, 123,

Bound Tree Medical, Dublin, OH
#27, 30, 47, 48, 49, 52, 76, 77, 81, 89, 90, 91, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 102, 133, 134,
135, 136

Midwest Medical, Earth City, MO
#6, 25, 33, 44, 45, 46, 53, 55, 105, 106, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118, 127

Moore Medical, New Britain, CT
#5, 58, 59, 60, 67, 74, 108

Henry Schein, Melville, NY

#1,2,3,4,7,8,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17,18, 19, 21, 22, 28, 29, 31, 32, 34, 35, 36, 37,
38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 50, 51, 54, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 75, 78, 79, 80,
82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 92, 93, 94, 103, 104, 107, 109, 110, 124, 125, 126

Southeastern Emergency Equipment, Wake Forest, NC
#9, 20, 23, 26, 56, 57, 111, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132
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Ocean City Beach Patrol Medical Supply

Bound Tree Medical, Dublin, OH
#4,6,7

Henry Schein, Melville, NY
#3,5,8,9

Southeastern Emergency Equipment, Wake Forest, NC
#1,2



FY’11 EMERGENCY SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY SPREAD SHEET

SA

# | Quantity | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry | South-
Number Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein |eastern
1] 10 Cases 116 Medical 7-10 Gallon Biohazard 57.97 50/cs 48.19 55/CS 41.06 .94
Action Bags ca/500 10/pk
2| 10 Cases | KE 3033 Kendall [ Sterile 4x4 25 Pks of 2 Ply | 2.58 tr/50 | 64.32/cs 61.76 295 EA 55.21 59.28/cs
Cases/24 Per Case 25pk/2
3] 10 Cases | KE 9190 Kendall Sterile 5x9 16 Per Box 90.64 104.16/cs| 100.40 88.57 1.67/bx
ca/432
4] 40 Boxes 9-001 Kendall | Ammonia Inhalants 10 Per| No bid 2.58 bx 1.75 2.10 1.38 1.58/bx
Box
5] 25 Bottles | 1420-95 | St.Joseph | 81mg Chewable Aspirin No bid | .81 bottle .79 75 EA 2.32 .99/btl
6] 15 Boxes 315 Dynarex 1 3/4" Butterfly Box 100 No bid 1.79 bx 1.29 4.00 EA 3.75 No bid
Sheer
7| 25 Boxes | JJ 4644 | Johnson& 1"x3" Band Aids Sheer No bid 3.55 bx 3.46 3.13 EA 3.03 3.59/bx
Johnson
8| 20 Boxes | JJ5716 |Johnson&j| 2"x4 1/2" Extra Large 136.10 5.89 bx 5.73 5.18 EA 5.06 5.96/bx
ohnson | Band Aids ca/l8 bx
9] 2 Cases 5180B | Roehampt Sterile Burn Sheets/12 | 14.16 ea |131.76 cs| 180.00 | 555EA | 176.07 142.56
on Per Case cs/24
10| 8 Cases 980011 Laerdal Stiffneck Select Adult 5.75ea |256.00cs| 520.50 5.20ea | 4.75ea 5.19 ea
Collars
11] 2 Cases 980021 Laerdal Stffneck Select Pediatric 5.75ea |102.40cs| 208.20 5.20ea | 4.75ea 5.19 ea
Collars
12] 2 Cases MX 13- Cavicide Cavicide Disenfectant 7.92ea | 90.36 cs 83.04 6.95ea | 5.65.ea | 6.39 ea
1024 Spray 240z bottle 24.02 bx
13| 4 Cases Rusch 37F Roll Pack Easy Tubes | 35.40 ea |173.16 cs| 167.95 52.61/cs | 39.57 ea




14

15

16

17

18

19
20

21
22
23

24
25

26
27

28
29
30
31

32
33

Quantity | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry | South-
Number Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein |eastern
4 Cases Rusch 41F Roll Pack Easy Tubes | 35.40 ea |173.16 cs| 167.95 | 49.00 ea | 50.27/cs | 39.57 ea
50 Boxes KE- Kendall LP 12 Trace Paper 2 per | 3.69 ea 382.00 7.63/2 9.90/3 pk 10.61
31091427 box /100 rolls 18/cs bx/3
68.67
20 Each 1527-1 3M Trace Prep Tape 11.32 1.1791 .80 13.50ea| .80ea 9.77/bx
bx/12
24 Each 0500-1 Dey Epi Pen 0.3mg Auto No bid | 82.23/ea 92.57 85.00 ea | 65.50 ea | No bid
Injector
24 Each 0501-1 Dey Epi Pen JR 0.15mg Auto No bid | 82.23/ea 92.57 85.00ea | 65.51 ea | No bid
Injector
20 Each A 4520 7.5" Bandage Scissors 1.00ea | 1.38ea 1.78 895ea | 1.34ea | 1.58ea
8 Cases | BB-6139- Braun 250mL Sterile Water 24 37.00 33.12 ea 30.29 1.19ea | 36.01/cs | 28.56 cs
22 Per Case ca/24 24
100 Each | KE 8301 Kendall P2 Sharps Shuttle 155ea | 1.60ea 154 1l65ea | 1.39ea | 1.51lea
2 Cases K-8970 Kendall Sharps Containers 3.27ea | 67.60cs 65.29 365ea | 283ea | 3.19ea
20 Each 760-A Prosphyg Spygmomanometers 18.85ea | 15.84 ea 15.89 19.50 ea | 13.58 ea | 5.69 ea
Regular Adult
15 Each 7522 EMI Ring Cutters 460ea | 14.02ea 6.84 2325ea | 5.08ea | 4.37ea
2 Cases BE- Bemis 1200cc Green Top Suction| 3.10ea |155.04cs| 110.88 3.10ea | 24lea | 2.76ea
484410 Canisters
2 Cases | CN-34880| Conmed Yankauer Suction Tips 1.04ea | 4250cs 50.00 220ea | 1.82ea 41 ea
2 Cases [ CN-37040| Conmed Suction Tubing 82.50 41.50 cs 47.22 1.30ea | 1.49ea .94 ea
ca/50
30 Each |3 PK/31 Vilant 3 Pack Cherry Insta No bid 11.56 pk 5.05 14.50 ea | 8.02/pk 3 | No bid
Gr Glucose 15.15/pk
2 Boxes | M2524A Oridion Smart Capnoline 25 Per 301.25 9.49 ea No bid 13.00 ea | 219.26 |279.75/bx
Box Pedi per 25 bx 25
4 Boxes | M2526A Oridion Smart Capnoline 25 Per 301.25 | 10.25ea No bid 13.00 ea | 268.13 |279.75/bx
Box Adult per 25 bx 25
3 Cases 38874 Gemco Alcare Plus 5.4 0z Cans | 6.44ea |162.96cs| 131.51 8.25ea | 4.43ea |150.56 cs
15 Each N 0101 Meconium Aspirators 413 ea | 4.27ea 4.90 445ea | 3.70ea | 4.12ea
4 boxes | 3M 1860 3M N-95 Masks Regular .89 ea | 18.29 bx 16.61 22.00ea | .84ea 17.64

bx/20




34

35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42
43

44

45

46

47

48

49

50

Quantitiy | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry | South-
Number Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein |eastern
12 Each 79541 |Nitrolingua| 0.4 mg Nitro Spray 4.9gm No bid [265.00ea| 221.34 No bid 121.97 No bid
| 200 Metered Doses
2 Boxes D-20 Nellcor Pediatric Oxysensor 24 327.36 |338.40bx| 326.33 | 16.00ea | 294.25 | 13.59 ea
Per Box per 24 /b24
6 Boxes D-25 Nellcor Adult Oxysensor 24 Per 327.36 |338.40bx| 326.33 | 16.00ea | 292.09 | 13.59 ea
Box per 24 /b24
4 Cases | KE 2247 Kendall |[4"Kling Non Sterile 12 Per 5.63 46.56 cs 44.90 6.00 ea 40.09 5.61
Bag 96 Per Case bx /12 cs/96 bx/12
5 Cases | KE 2249 Kendall | 6" Kling Non Sterile 6 Per [4.19 bx/ 6 | 34.63 cs 33.41 5.15ea 30.09 |4.18/bx16
Bag 48 Per Case cs/48 33.44/cs
15 Boxes |3M 1527-1 3M Transpore Tape 1" 12 Per 11.32 14.15 bx 9.60 14.15 ea 9.51 9.99
Box bx/12 12/bx bx/12
15 Boxes |3M 1527-2 3M Transpore Tape 2" 6 Per 11.78 14.15 bx 9.60 14.15 ea 7.41 9.99
Box bx/6 6/bx bx/16
4 Boxes |3M 1624W 3M Tegaderm 100 Per Box 31.08 30.11 bx 33.45 37.96ea| 24.19 30.12
6X7 cm bx/100 bx/100
3 Cases | KE 1967 Kendall [ Trauma Dressings 120.50 ca|123.00 cs | 120.17 Nobid | 2.16ea | 2.39ea
5 Dozen MS TR Triangular Bandages 2.42 2.31 bx 2.76 3.35ea .23 ea .26 ea
40 [ pk/12 46.20 cs
2 Dozen | 30-1080 Magnum Trauma Shears | 1.00 ea .99 ea 9.72/.81 No bid 1l12ea | 1.06ea
Red ea
4 Boxes 600- Thomas | Adult Endotracheal Tube | 2.77ea | 2.71ea | 67.25/25 | 295ea | 2.70ea | 2.76 ea
020001 | oo Holder .
1 Box 600- Thomas Pediatric Endotracheal 277ea | 271ea | 67.25/25 | 295ea | 2.70ea | 2.76 ea
030001 Tube Holder
2 Cases 8400-L Tyvek No bid |112.02cs| NoBid |[120.00/cs| No bid No bid
2 Cases | 8400-XL Tyvek No bid |112.02cs| Nobid |[120.00/cs| No bid No bid
4 Cases | 11996000 | Medtronic 465.00 | 30.24pr | 416.00 No bid 92.41 No bid
017 bx/10 cs/10
2 Cases (11996000 | Medtronic No bid 96.59 pr 366.40 No bid 75.21 23.13 ea
016 cs/10 231.30




51

52

53

54

55

56
57

58

59

60

61

62

63
64

65

66

bx/10

Quantity | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry | South-
Number) | Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein |eastern
2 Boxes | 3M 9660 3M Surgical Clipper Blade 211.00 |218.00 bx| 212.73 450 ea 145.50 223.38
Assembly 50 Per Box per 50 bx 50 cs/50
12 Each | ADC 603 ADC Adscope Stethoscope 27.78 ea | 21.21 ea 23.30 85.50ea | 23.85ea | 27.69 ea
Black
12 Each | ADC 602 ADC Cardiology Scope 56.41ea | 51.01 ea 48.24 155.00 | 52.68 ea | 56.24 ea
Burgundy ea
12 Each | DRPT3B2 DGR Traditional Scope Black No bid | 52.44 ea No bid No bid 6.28 ea | 58.84 ea
7
10 Packs S3604 Disposable Pen Light w/ | 4.50 pk/6 | 5.01 pk 3.42 4.75ea | 4.136/pk| .69ea
Pupil Gauge 6 Per Pack 4.14 pk/6
2 Cases | HU 1059 Hudson |Adult NRB Mask With Vent| .98 ea 51.00 cs 50.56 1.10ea | 1.15ea | 49.00/cs
1 Case |MS-25058 | Micromist | Pedatric NRB Mask With 61.50 63.00cs [36.25(not| 1.35ea | l.14ea 1.06 ea
Vent ca/50 brand) 53/cs
1 Case RU Micromist Infant NRB Mask With 3.50ea |140.00cs| 142.00 270ea | 400ea | 3.98ea
395497 Vent 199/cs
1 Case HU 1838 Husdon Pediatric Nasal Canula 68.50 52.50 cs 69.40 .75 ea 1.29 ea .98/ea
ca/50 49/cs
4 Cases 81043 Starline Peroxide 16 oz Bottles 1.03ea | 14.64 cs 7.77 45 ea 12.25 ATlea
cs/24 5.64/cs
12 Boxes S3511 Dynarex Medium Alcohol Preps 1.35 1.46 bx 1.35 150ea | 1.37ea 1.36
Medium 200 Per box bx/200 bx/200
12 Boxes S3509 PDI Nail Polish Remover Pads | No bid 3.21 bx 3.13 2.95ea 2.77 3.13
100 Per Box 100/bx bx/100
300 Each | LA983032 | Laerdal | Speedblock Set 35.40 ea | 20.70 ea 3443 | 21.00ea | 17.90 ea | 19.96/set
1 Case 7828A | MediTrace | Mini Foam 133 Pediatric | .47 Pch/3 [606.00 cs| 94.23 .60 ea 84.31 10.01
“““““““““““““““““ Electrodes . ¢s/600 pk/60
2 Cases 7209A | MediTrace 533 Adult 3 Pouch 102.70 [106.10cs| 102.35 | 11.50ea| 96.51 10.87
Case/600 ca/600 ¢s/600 3/pk
20/pks/bx
10 Boxes 4336 HypoGuar | Blood Glucose, Lancet, 24.78 30.48 bx 21.25 No bid 17.51 22.31
d Manual, Green Top bx/150 bx/150 bx/150

Hemolance1l50/bx
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Quantity | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry | South-
Number Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein |eastern
10 Boxes 7099C |Contour Bayer Contour Glucose No bid 23.78 bx 23.80 23.50 ea 39.63 23.53
Micro-fill Test Strips 50/box bx/100 bx/50
1 Box BD BD Insyte | Autoguard IV Cath Non 117.50 [119.00 bx| 114.70 104.84 87.47 118.18
381467 Winged 14Ga 50bx bx/50 ea 50/bx bx/50
2 Boxes BD BD Insyte | Autoguard IV Cath Non 117.50 [119.00 bx| 114.70 104.84 102.01 118.18
381454 Winged 16Ga 50bx bx/50 ea 50/bx bx/50
2 Boxes BD BD Insyte | Autoguard IV Cath Non 11750 [113.00 bx| 108.82 | 99.46 ea 94.51 112.12
381444 Winged 18 Ga 50bx bx/50 50/bx bx/50
2 Boxes BD BD Insyte | Autoguard IV Cath Non 11750 [113.00 bx| 108.82 | 99.46 ea 96.45 112.12
381434 Winged 20 Ga 50bx bx/50 50/bx bx/50
2 Boxes BD BD Insyte | Autoguard IV Cath Non 11750 [113.00 bx| 108.82 | 99.46 ea 97.45 112.12
381423 Winged 22 Ga 50bx bx/50 50/bx bx/50
2 Boxes BD BD Insyte | Autoguard IV Cath Non 117.50 [102.00 bx| 108.82 | 99.46 ea 96.51 112.12
381412 Winged 24 Ga 50 bx bx/50 50/bx bx/50
4 Cases 2B2324 Baxter Ringers lactate1000mL 12 2591 18.90 cs 18.40 1.15ea 17.89 1.24 ea
per CS (see Note 1) ca/l2 cs/12 17.36
____________________________________________ cs/14
4 Cases 2B2323 Baxter Ringers lactate 500mL 24 31.31 28.32 cs 23.62 .95 ea 18.97 94 ea
per CS (see Note 1) ca/24 cs/24 22.56
“““““““““““““““““““““ cs/24
2 Cases 6640B Morrison | 2X9 ArmBoards Case/100 59.00 31.50 cs 69.80 3.00 ea 56.01 .8l ea
................................................................... ca/100 ¢s/100 81/100
3 Cases 6642B Morrison 3X18 ArmBoards 63.00 47.00 cs 95.07 1.00 ea 81.01 .99 ea
“““““““ Case/100 ca/100 ¢s/100 99/100
1 Case 9634B ADI Rolled Blue Non Latex 80.00 5.00 roll No bid 9.25ea | 103.71 | .96 10/pk
“““““ Tourniquet 1000/Case | ca/100 cs/1000 | 96/1000
1 Case 1323B lllinois Sternal/llliac Needle 18ga 92.00 86.10 cs | 200.15 No bid 82.21 8.49
“““““““ Case/10 ca/10 cs/10 84.90/10
1 case 1322B Illinois Sternal/llliac Needle 15ga 92.00 86.10 cs 200.15 No bid 82.21 8.49
“““““““““““““““““““““ Case/10 | ca/l10 cs/10 84.90/10
1 Box 309603 BD 5cc Luer Lok Tip Syringe No bid 11.02 bx 13.45 25.00 ea 12.45 9.78
“““““““ 100/Box bx/100 bx/100
2 Boxes 309604 BD 10cc Luer Lok Tip Syringe | No bid 11.40 bx 11.13 12.75 ea 9.85 11.76
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100/Box bx/100 bx/100
Quantity | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry | South-
Number| | Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein | eastern
2 Boxes SS60L Terumo | 60cc Luer Lok Tip Syringe | No bid | 13.00 bx 9.79 13.05 ea 8.41 11.17
25/Box 25/bx bx/25
2 Boxes BD BD lcc Safety Syringe With No bid | 19.36 bx 18.67 19.50 ea 16.35 19.96
305903 Needle 50/Box 50/bx bx/50
2 Boxes BD BD 3cc Safety Syringe With No bid | 17.95 bx 17.32 18.00 ea 15.52 18.51/bx
305906 Needle 50/ Box 50/bx 50
2 Boxes BD BD 23ga Safety Needle Only No bid | 15.50 bx 14.92 15.50 ea 13.32 15.96
305902 __Box/50 50/bx | bx/50
4 Cases |[LA985080| Laerdal V-Vac Replacement 70.80 per | 18.29 ea 68.84 18.75 ea 60.73 17.67 ea
Cartridge 4/Count 4 4/ctn
25 Cases 2594B KwikCold | 6x9 Regular Instant Cold 11.98 11.36 cs No bid 11.00 cs 5.91 6.18
Ice Pack Case/24 ca/24 24/cs cs/24
2 Boxes RU Rusch 5.0 Cuffed ET Tubes 10 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30 ea 12.11 1.17 ea
11208205 /Box bx/10 bx/10 11.70
0 bx/10
2 Boxes RU Rusch 5.5 Cuffed ET Tubes 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30 ea 12.01 1.17 ea
11208205 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.70
S b bx/10
2 Boxes RU Rusch 6.0 Cuffed ET Tubes 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30 ea 11.91 1.17 ea
11208206 10/box bx/10 bx10 11.70
0 bx/10
2 Boxes RU Rusch 6.5 Cuffed ET Tubes 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30ea 10.21 117 ea
11208206 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.70
5 bx/10
4 Boxes RU Rusch 7.0 Cuffed ET Tubes 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30 ea 10.01 1.17 ea
11208207 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.70
0 bx/10
4 Boxes RU Rusch 7.5 Cuffed ET Tubes 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30 ea 9.81 1.17 ea
11208207 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.70
5 | 4 bx/10
2 Boxes RU Rusch 8.0 Cuffed ET Tubes 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30 ea 11.51 1.17 ea
11208208 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.70
0 bx/10
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Quantity | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry
Number| | Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein
2 Boxes RU Rusch 8.5 Cuffed ET Tubes 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30 ea 12.01 1.17 ea
11208208 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.70
5 4 bx/10
2 Boxes RU Rusch 9.0 Cuffed ET Tubes 12.10 11.40 bx 11.93 1.30 ea 11.91 1.17 ea
11208209 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.70
O ............................................ bX/lO
2 Boxes RU Rusch 2.5 Uncuffed ET Tubes 12.10 10.80 bx 11.36 1.20 ea 11.31 1.11 ea
10038202 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.10
5 bx/10
2 Boxes RU Rusch 3.0 Uncuffed ET Tubes 12.10 10.80 bx 11.36 1.20 ea 10.81 l.1llea
10038203 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.10
0 bx/10
2 Boxes RU Rusch 3.5 Uncuffed ET Tubes 12.10 10.80 bx 11.36 1.20 ea 10.91 1.11 ea
10038203 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.10
5 bx/10
2 Boxes RU Rusch 4.0 Uncuffed ET Tubes 12.10 10.80 bx 11.36 1.20 ea 10.81 1.11 ea
10038204 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.10
O ............................................ bX/lO
2 Boxes RU Rusch 4.5 Uncuffed ET Tubes 12.10 10.80 bx 11.36 1.20 ea 10.81 l.1lea
10038204 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 11.10
s | 4 bx/10
12 Each | ADC 315 ADC Intubation Style Magill 6.77 ea 3.62 ea 5.29 3.40ea | 3.30ea 5.93 ea
““““““““ Forceps Pediatric
12 Each | ADC 315 ADC Intubation Style Magill 6.77 ea 3.62 ea 5.29 3.75ea | 3.33ea 5.93 ea
“““““““ Forceps Adult
2 Boxes LA 400 Laerdal |Thomas Pediatric ET Tube| 2.77 ea 2.7l ea 67.25 3.00 ea 67.26 2.76 ea
...................... Holders bx/25
4 Boxes LA 500 Laerdal Thomas Adult ET Tube 2.77 ea 2.7l ea 67.25 3.00 ea 67.26 2.76 ea
“““““““ Holders bx/25
12 Each RU Rusch Quick Trach Emergency |146.54 ea|120.42 ea| 125.00 140.00 |[108.91ea|117.71ea
12090004 Cric Kits ea
0
24 Each Cook Cook Needle Decompression 77.34 ea | 90.75 ea 89.02 1450ea | No bid 77.34 ea
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Kits Complete

Quantity | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry | South-
Number| | Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein | eastern
3 Boxes 1627A Endotrol 6.0 Tracheal Tube With 88.10 9.11ea 87.85 No bid 78.71 9.34 ea
Controllable Tip 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 93.40
bx/10
3 Boxes 1628A Endotrol 7.0 Tracheal Tubes With 88.10 9.11 ea 87.85 No bid 78.71 9.34 ea
Controllable Tip 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 93.40
____________________________________________ bx/10
6 Boxes 5245A Beck Beck Airway Airflow 76.70 per | 61.00 bx 98.21 6.35ea 75.51 5.88 ea
Monitor count/10 10 bx/10 58.80/bx
2 Boxes RU Rusch 6FR Whistle tip Suction 3.40 17.00 bx 3.18 No bid 3.21 .23 ea
40450060 _Cath 10/box bx/10 bx/10 2.30 bx
3 Boxes RU Rusch 8FR Whistle Tip Suction 3.40 17.00 bx 3.18 No bid 3.21 23 ea
40450080 Cath 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 2.30 bx
3 Boxes RU Rusch 10FR Whistle Tip Suction 3.40 17.00 bx 3.18 No bid 3.21 .23 ea
40450010 _Cath 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 2.30 bx
3 Boxes RU Rusch 12 FR Whistle Tip Suction 3.40 17.00 bx 3.18 No bid 3.21 23 ea
40450012 Cath 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 2.30 bx
3 Boxes RU Rusch 14FR Whistle Tip Suction 3.40 17.00 bx 3.18 No bid 3.31 23 ea
40450014 _Cath 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 2.30 bx
3 Boxes RU Rusch 16 FR Whistle Tip Suction 3.40 17.00 bx 3.18 .50 ea 3.31 .23 ea
40450016 Cath 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 |2.30 bx
3 Boxes RU Rusch 18 FR Whistle Tip Suction 3.40 17.00 bx 3.18 No bid 3.31 23 ea
40450018 Cath 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 2.30 bx
0
4 Boxes | MV 1217- MV 10 FR Gastric Sump 18.30 2.30 ea 7.50 No bid 19.31 2.24 ea
10 Tubes Salem 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 22.40 bx
4 Boxes | MV 1217- MV 12FR Gastric Sump Tube 18.30 2.30 ea 7.50 No bid 19.61 2.24 ea
12 Salem 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 22.40 bx
4 Boxes | MV 1217- MV 14 FR Gastric Sump 18.30 2.30 ea 7.50 No bid 18.81 2.24 ea
14 Tubes Salem 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 22.40 bx
4 Boxes | MV 1217- MV 16 FR Gastric Sump 18.30 2.30 ea 7.50 No bid 19.61 2.24 ea
16 Tubes Salem 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 22.40 bx
4 Boxes | MV 1217- MV 18 FR Gastric Sump 18.30 2.30 ea 7.50 2.50 ea 17.01 2.24 ea
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18 Tubes Salem 10/Box bx/10 bx/10 22.40 bx
Quantity | Item Brand Description AllMed | Bound | Midwest | Moore | Henry | South-
Number) | Tree | Medical | Medical | Schein |eastern
3 Packs 11996- | Medtronic | Adult Quick Combo Pads [930.00 bh| 30.24 pr | 416.00 | 32.50ea | 305.41 No bid
000017 ERS 20 Per Pack per 20 set pk/20
1 Case 2C6509 Baxter Interlink System Continu- | 458.40 |147.36cs| 416.55 No bid 76.71 No bid
Flo Solution Set 48/case cal48 48/ca
5 Boxes 177268 | Capnoline | Smart Capnoline,oxygen No bid [256.25bx| 292.19 |[15.00ea | 9.07ea | 11.19ea
intermediate 279.75
bx/25
10 Boxes | L 983060 Laerdal Universal Base only 2354 ea | 24.33 ea 22.89 25.50 ea 39.54 24.94 ea
ea 249.40
____________________________________________ bx/10
4 Boxes 025304 | GreenLine | Macintosh#4 Disposable | 3.84 ea | 78.40 bx 78.59 5.00ea | 4.13ea | 3.42ea
Fiber optic Laryngoscope 68.40
“““““““ Blades bx/20
4 Boxes 025333 | Greenline Miller # 3 Disposable 3.84 ea | 78.40 bx 78.59 5.00ea | 4.20ea | 3.42ea
Fiber optic Laryngoscope 68.40
............ Blades bx/20
2 Boxes 025303 | Greenline | Macintosh # 3 Disposable | 3.84 ea | 78.40 bx 78.59 5.00ea | 4.14ea | 342ea
Fiber Optic Laryngoscope 68.40
Blades bx/20
2 Boxes 025332 | Greenline | Miller # 2Disposable Fiber | 3.84 ea | 78.40 bx 78.59 5,00ea | 4.22ea | 3.42ea
Optic Laryngoscope 68.40
____________ Blades bx/20
10 Boxes | 175031 | Suretemp | Disposable Probe covers 10.27 1.06 bx 1.05 9.56 ea 7.31 10.24
25/bx bx/250 bx/25 bx/250
5 Cases 531900 | Emergent CPAP OS Breathing 424.25 |304.90 cs | Exclusive | 120.00 No bid | 31.25ea
Circuit with Medium Mask ca/l0 ea 312.50
10 each/case cs/10
2 Cases | 1900-888 | Emergent | CPAP Large Adult Mask 627.50 |463.50 cs | Exclusive | 47.25ea | No bid 9.50 ea
50/case ca/50 475.00/50
2 Cases | 121907-1 | Emergent [CPAP Small Mask 50/case| 526.88 |360.00 cs | Exclusive | No bid No bid 7.40 ea
CA/50 370.00/50
5 Boxes Microstrea | NIV Line Adult 25/Box No bid [250.00 bx| No bid No bid 688.51 No bid
mTM bx/25




OCBP MEDICAL SUPPLY BID LIST FOR 2011

Allmed|Bound [Midwest| Moore | Henry |South-
Tree |Medical|Medical| Schein |eastern
Type | Quantity Iltem Num. Brand Description
No bid| 7.15 | NB 9.92 ea| 6.89
Each | 48 #170 Sealeasy |Adult Mini Kit CPR Mask ea ea
No bid| 1.19 | NB 1.07 | 1.01
Box 100 |7028LF 1 inch| Kendall Small Band-Aids bx 50/bx | bx/50
No bid| 5.88 | NB 3.78 [No bid
Box 24 NON25504 Medline Large Band-Aids bx 50/bx
No bid| 6.71 | NB .77 |No bid
Box 100 #213-014 CSM Sting Kill Wipes bx 10/bx
No bid| 4.01 | NB 2.49 ea|No bid
Each 50 20z Bactine | First Aid Antiseptic liquid ea
No bid| 48.17| NB 37.47 |No bid
Case| 14 #619 Cramer Trainers Athletic Tape CcS 24 rllcs
No bid| 11.36 | NB 25.01/ |No bid
Case 12 RA08310B | Medi-First Instant Ice Packs CcS CS
4.19 | 433 | 4.18 3.79 | 4.09
pk/100| bx 100/bx | bx
Box 24 #3354 4X4 Large Gauze Pads /100
2.58 | 2.60 | 2.55 95 | 252
pk/100| bx 50/pk | bx
Box 24 #3353 3X3 Small Gauze Pads /100
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