Beach Patrol Medical Supplies

Emergency Southeastern
Est. | BoundTree | Medical Ever | Henry | Moore | Shabach | Emergency
Line Description Part # Brand UoM|Qty.| Medical Products | Ready | Schein | Medical | Services Equipment
1 Adult Mini Kit CPR Mask #170 Sealeasy Each | 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid [ No Bid 9.61 3.39 No Bid
2 Small Band-Aids 7028LF 1-inch Kendall Box | 100 | 1.49 100/bx No Bid 1.05 0.80 4.20 3.77 No Bid
3 Large Band-Aids NON25504 Medline Box 24 3.15 40/bx No Bid 3.90 3.76 62.16 3.77 No Bid
4 Sting Kill Wipes #213-014 CcSm Box | 100 | 4.45 150/bx No Bid 0.60 0.84 18.80 6.98 No Bid
5 First Aid Antiseptic liquid 20z Bactine Each | 50 1.19 No Bid 3.95 3.65 3.50 7.98 No Bid
6 Trainers Athletic Tape #619 Cramer Case | 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid | 27.80 34.80 55.49 No Bid
7 Instant Ice Packs RA083108B Medi-First Case 12 8.79 24/bx No Bid No Bid | 6.28 17.35 47.18 No Bid
8 Large Gauze Pads #3354 4x4 Box 24 | 5.17 100/bx 5.00 4.30 4.88 70.92 19.62 No Bid
9 Small Gauze Pads #3353 3x3 Box 24 | 2.98 100/bx 2.84 2.90 2.42 94.32 12.98 No Bid
10 Individually wrapped gauze rolls Not specified 2x2 Each | 150 0.37 2.33 0.08 0.05 2.49 10.76 No Bid
11 Triangular bandages individually wrapped Not specified | 36”x36” x51” | Each 50 0.28 0.27 0.36 0.17 0.30 7.99 0.32




