

FY 2021 Water & Wastewater Chemical Bids

Vendors	WATER DEPARTMENT					WASTE WATER DEPARTMENT							
	Liquid Caustic Soda 50%	Potassium Permanganate	Chlorine (1 Ton Cylinder)	Chlorine (150 lb Cylinder)	Polymer (Potable Water) Clarifloc-N-3300P	HTH (100 Lb. Pail)	Lime (Tons)	Liquid Caustic Soda 50%	Sodium Hypochlorite 15%	Sulfuric Acid 66%	Magnesium Hydroxide	Sodium Bisulfate	Polymer ZETAG-8946FS
Shannon Chemical Corp.													
Premier Magnesia	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$39130	NO BID	NO BID
PVS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$130,300	NO BID
Brenttag Northeast	193,674 ³	34,049	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Prelevic	NO BID	\$22,239.12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1490.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Shannon Chemical	NO BID	\$29,480.45	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Chemrite, Inc.													
Colony Pool Service	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	114.941	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kuehne Company													
Tidewater Products, Inc.													
George S. Coyne Chemical Co.	NO BID	\$30873.39	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,452.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11,217.23	NO BID	\$125,409.	\$11,843.00
Greer Industries, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	100,974	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Intercoastal Trading, Inc.	\$214,368 ⁸	\$71,028	NO BID	\$3,465.15	NO BID	\$1,870.00	NO BID	\$7,866.15	\$5895.00	\$20,410.00	41,470	138,890	NO BID
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	\$40,000.00	\$1,469.79	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Marubeni Specialty Chemicals, Inc.	NO BID	\$20,859.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$122,400.00
Polydyne Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,537.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$103,500.00
Univar	\$194,350	\$63,413.00	\$68,300.00	\$5421.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12045.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID