

Fire Station 2 Roofing

Bid Tab

Vendor	Bid
AJT Homes LLC	no bid
All States Construction	no bid
Apex Contracting	no bid
Celtic Nations	no bid
Diamond	no bid
F.A. Taylor & Son	no bid
Mills Creek Builders	no bid
Patterson Construction	no bid
Peninsula Roofing	no bid
Shore Siding	Base Bid: \$30,095.00 Alt 1: \$19,962.00 Hourly Labor Rate: \$85.00
Spicer Brothers Roofing	no bid
Tecta America	no bid
Walsh Home Improvement	Base Bid: \$29,950.00 Alt 1: N/A Hourly Labor Rate: N/A
Paradise	Base Bid: \$89,900.00 Alt 1: \$42,600.00 Hourly Labor Rate: \$125.00
Diamond Contractors	Base Bid: \$26,602.00 Alt 1: \$19,875.00 Hourly Labor Rate: \$49.50
Detwiler Roofing	Base Bid: \$74,000.00 Alt 1: \$44,000.00 Hourly Labor Rate: \$120.00
Fitzhugh Rueben LLC	Base Bid: \$43,000.00 Alt 1: \$29,850.00 Hourly Labor Rate: \$32.60
St. Mary's Roofing & Home Improvement	Base Bid: \$36,344.00 Alt 1: \$22,126.00 Hourly Labor Rate: \$55.00